PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID R-BB-9023
AUTOMOTIVE BODY REPAIR & PAINTING SERVICES — ON SITE & OFF SITE
March 26, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION
Bristow Collision Center Dumfries Autobody and Frame PWLYV Enterprises, Inc.
Dongkyun Lee, President y . Dba ColorAll of Fredericksburg
: Darrell Sturgell, President . .
10111 Residency Rd. 17484-B Jefferson Davis H Harlow Stilwell Jr., President
Section A — On Site Automotive Body Repair Services Suite # 102 : Wy P.O. Box 6301
Dumfries, VA 22026 .
Manassas, VA 20110 Telephone: 703-221-3033 Springfield, VA 22150
Telephone: 703-367-9899 FF;X' 70.3-221-2066 Telephone: 540-604-7436
Fax: 703-369-3305 ' Fax: 703-543-6645
Item Estimated
# Description Annual Hourly Rate | Total Amount | Hourly Rate | Total Amount | Hourly Rate | Total Amount
Hours

Repair of Automotive Body — Cars . . $60.00

7.1A and Light Trucks 50 No Bid No Bid $34.00 $1,700.00 Paint/Materials $3,000.00
Repair of Automotive Body — $90.00

7.2A | School Buses and Heavy Duty 100 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $4,200.00 Pai /M. il $9,000.00
Trucks aint/Materials
Painting of Automotive Body — Cars . . $60.00

7.3A and Light Trucks 50 No Bid No Bid $54.00 $2,700.00 Paint/Materials $3,000.00
Painting of Automotive Body — $90.00

7.4A | School Buses and Heavy Duty 50 No Bid No Bid $62.00 $3,100.00 Pai t/M.t il $4,500.00
Trucks aint/Materials

GRAND TOTA!_ l-}MOUNT_— On Site Automotive Body No Bid $11,700.00 $19,500.00

Repair and Painting Services

Section B — Off Site Automotive Body Repair Services

Item Estimated

# Description Annual Hourly Rate | Total Amount | Hourly Rate | Total Amount | Hourly Rate | Total Amount
Hours

Repair of Automotive Body — Cars $60.00

7.1B and Light Trucks 30 $32.00 $960.00 $34.00 $1,020.00 Paint/Materials $1,800.00
Repair of Automotive Body — $90.00

7.2B | School Buses and Heavy Duty 50 $60.00 $3,000.00 $42.00 $2,100.00 . e $4,500.00
Trucks Paint/Materials
Painting of Automotive Body — Cars $60.00

7.3B and Light Trucks 30 $52.00 $1,560.00 $54.00 $1,620.00 Paint/Materials $1,800.00
Painting of Automotive Body — $90.00

7.4B | School Buses and Heavy Duty 30 $80.00 $2,400.00 $62.00 $1,860.00 . e $2,700.00
Trucks Paint/Materials

GRAND TOTA!_ l-}MOUNT_— Off Site Automotive Body $7.920.00 $6,600.00 $10,800.00

Repair and Painting Services




