Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Musical Instruments

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts

4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703

Louis Luzzi,

School Bids Coordinator

Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
Item Description Hourly Labor Rate | Parts % Discount
8.1.1. | Baritone, 3-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.2. | Baritone, 3-valve (silver-piated) $60.00 20%
8.1.3. [ Baritone, 4-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.4. | Baritone, 4-valve, (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.5. | Bassoon (plastic) $60.00 20%
8.1.6. | Bow Re-Hair — Bass $60.00 20%
8.1.7. | Bow Re-Hair — Cello $60.00 20%
8.1.8. | Bow Re-Hair — Viola $60.00 20%
8.1.9. | Bow Re-Hair — Violin $60.00 20%
8.1.10 Clarinet, Bass (plastic) $60.00 20%
8.1.11) Clarinet, Bass (wood) $60.00 20%
8.1.12 Clarinet, Bb (wood) $60.00 20%
8.1.13] Clarinet, Bb (plastic) $60.00 20%
8.1.14| Chimes (Concert) $60.00 20%
8.1.15! Drums {Bass, Snare, Toms) $60.00 20%
8.1.16, Euphonium, 3-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.17. ;‘;‘t’:‘;’)”i“m' 3-vave (silver- $60.00 20%
8.1.18| Euphonium, 4-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.19 EI:f:(%nium, 4-valve (silver- $60.00 20%
8.1.20/ Flute, Closed hole (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.21) Flute, Open hole (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.22| French Horn, Double (lacquer) $60.00 20%




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Musical Instruments

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts

4626 Wedgewood Blvd.
Frederick, MD 21703

Louis Luzzi,

School Bids Coordinator

Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
Item Description Hourly Labor Rate Parts % Discount
French Horn, Double (silver- o
8.1.23. plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.24; French Hom, Single (lacquer) $60.00 20%
French Horn, Single (silver- 0
8.1.25. plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.26, Guitars (acoustic) $60.00 20%
8.1.27, Guitars (electric) $60.00 20%
8.1.28| Hand Drums $60.00 20%
Mallet Instruments — Elementary General Music
8.1.20| Glockenspiels — All Sizes $60.00 20%
Metallaphones — All Sizes $60.00 20%
Xylophones — All Sizes $60.00 20%
8.1.30| Marimbas $60.00 20%
8.1.31| Mellophone (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.32| Mellophone (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.33| Oboe (full-conservatory) $60.00 20%
8.1.34| Oboe (modified key system) $60.00 20%
8.1.35) Orchestra Bells $60.00 20%
8.1.36 Piccolo (plastic) $60.00 20%
8.1.37 Piccolo (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.38| Saxophone, Alto (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.39/ Saxophone, Alto (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.40| Saxophone, Baritone (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.41, Saxophone, Baritone (silver- $60.00 20%
plated)
8.1.42| Saxophone, Soprano (lacquer) $60.00 20%




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Musical Instruments

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts

4626 Wedgewood Blvd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis L.uzzi, School Bids Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
item Description Hourly Labor Rate Parts % Discount
8143, ﬁgt(gg)hone, Soprano (silver- $60.00 20%
8.1.44,; Saxophone, Tenor (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.45| Saxophone, Tenor (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.46| Sousaphone (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.47,| Sousaphone {silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.48, Strings, Bass $60.00 20%
8.1.49/ Strings, Cello $60.00 20%
8.1.50, Strings, Viola $60.00 20%
8.1.51 Strings, Violin % $60.00 20%
8.1.52| Strings, Violin % $60.00 20%
8.1.53 Strings, Violin 4/4 $60.00 20%
8.1.54| Temple Blocks $60.00 20%
8.1.55] Timpani $60.00 20%
8.1.56,| Trombone (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.57) Trombone (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8158, (T;?:?::Se Double rotor $60.00 20%
8.1 59, ‘;;{;rg:)one, Double rotor (silver $60.00 20%
8.1.60| Trombone, Single rotor (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8161, 'Flj'll;s\o;:(tj))one, Single rotor (silver- $60.00 20%
8.1.62| Trumpet (All) (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.63| Trumpet (All) (silver-plated) $60.00 20%




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Musical Instruments

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts

4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703

Louis Luzzi,

School Bids Coordinator

Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
item Description " Hourly Labor Rate Parts % Discount
8.1.64| Tuba, 3-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.65; Tuba, 3-valve (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.66| Tuba, 4-valve (lacquer) $60.00 20%
8.1.67| Tuba, 4-valve (silver-plated) $60.00 20%
8.1.68, Vibraphone $60.00 20%
8.1.69.| Xylophone (Concert) $60.00 20%
Totails $0.00 $4,260.00




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Instrument Overhaul

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts
4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis Luzzi, School Bids
Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
Brass Instrument Overhaul
Item Description Unit Price Unit Price
Chem clean trumpet {remove all valves and tuning
82 1 slides, remove minor reachable dents, degrease $61.38
== 1 and clean, reassemble installing all new felts and '
corks, lubricate valves and tuning slides; playtest)
822 Restring French horn rotor (nothing is wrong with $15.11
== | rotor, just needs the string replace) |
Remove, clean and restring French horn rotor
8.2.3. | (remove, clean, lubricate and reinstali rotor and $30.20
restring.)
8.2.4. | Baritone, 3-valve (lacquer) $1,026.00
8.2.5. | Baritone, 3-valve (silver-plated) $1,409.00
8.2.6. | Baritone, 4-valve (lacquer) $1,296.00
8.2.7. | Baritone, 4-valve, (silver-plated) $1,701.00
8.2.8. | French Horn, Double {lacquer) $1,197.00
8.2.9. | French Horn, Double (silver-plated) $1,602.00
8.2.10. | French Horn, Single (lacquer) $828.00
8.2.11. | French Horn, Single (silver-plated) $1,211.00
8.2.12. | Sousaphone (lacquer) $3,911.00
8.2.13. | Sousaphone (silver-plated) $3,841.00
8.2.14. | Trombone {lacquer) $360.00




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services - instrument Overhaul

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone; (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts
4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis Luzzi, School Bids
Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: (301) 663-7754
8.2.15. | Trombone, Double rotor (lacquer) $783.00
8.2.16. | Trombone, Single rotor (lacquer) $738.00
8.2.17. | Trumpet (All) (lacquer) $347.00
8.2.18. | Trumpet (All) (silver-plated) $230.00
8.2.19. Pick—ulee}urn Cost f0|_' Instruments Deemed $0
Uneconomical to Repair
Percussion Instrument Overhaul

Item Description Unit Price Unit Price
8.2.20. | Chimes (Concert) No Bid
8.2.21. | Drums (Bass, Snare, Toms) No Bid
8.2.22. | Hand Drums No Bid
8.2.23. | Marimbas No Bid
8.2.24. | Orchestra Bells No Bid
8.2.25. | Temple Blocks No Bid
8.2.26. | Timpani No Bid
8.2.27. | Vibraphone No Bid
8.2.28. | Xylophone (Concert) No Bid

String Instrument Overhaul

ltem Description Unit Price Unit Price
8.2.29. | Bow Re-Hair — Bass $54.00
8.2.30. | Bow Re-Hair — Cello $45.00
8.2.31. | Bow Re-Hair — Viola $36.00
8.2.32. | Bow Re-Hair — Violin $36.00
8.2.33. | Guitars {Acoustic) $41.00




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — Instrument Overhaul

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts
4626 Wedgewood Blvd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis Luzzi, School Bids
Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: {301) 663-7754
8.2.34. | Guitars (Electric) $54.00
8.2.35. | Strings, Bass $268.00
8.2.36. | Strings, Cello $172.00
8.2.37. | Strings, Viola $86.00
8.2.38. | Strings, Violin %2 $70.00
8.2.39. | Strings, Violin % $70.00
8.2.40. | Strings, Violin 4/4 $70.00
Woodwind Instrument Overhaul
tem Description Unit Price Unit Price
Replacement of clarinet tenon cork (Remove old
8.2.41. cork, install and fit new cork) $18.60
Replacement of alto saxophone mouthpiece cork
8.242. (Remove old cork, install and fit new cork) $23.25
Replace flute headjoint cork (Remove old cork,
8.2.43. | install and fit new cork. Position new cork for $18.60
proper lining)
8.2.44. | Bassoon (plastic) $415.00
8.2.45. | Clarinet, Bass (plastic) $379.00
8.2.46. | Clarinet, Bass (wood) $379.00
8.2.47. | Clarinet, Bb (wood) $250.00
8.2.48. | Clarinet, Bb (plastic) $217.00
8.2.49. | Flute Closed Hole (silver-plated) $217.00




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services - Instrument Overhaul

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans
12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts
4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis Luzzi, School Bids
Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040

NO BID Fax: {301) 663-7754
8.2.50. | Flute Open Hole (silver-plated) $256.00
8.2.51. | Oboe (full-conservatory) $554.00
8.2.52. | Oboe (modified key system) $316.00
8.2.53. | Piccolo (plastic) $305.00
8.2.54. | Piccolo (silver-plated) $305.00
8.2.55. | Saxophone, Alto (lacquer) $521.00
8.2.56. | Saxophone, Baritone (lacquer) $675.00
8.2.57. | Saxophone, Soprano {lacquer) $583.00
8.2.58. | Saxophone, Tenor (lacquer) 583.00
Totals $0.00 $27,604.14




Bid Tabulation Musical Instrument Repair Parts & Services — PIANOS

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8018
February 28, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

Eliot D. Evans

12070 Greatbridge Rd.
Woodbridge, VA 22192
Eliot D. Evans, Owner
Phone: (703) 590-3685

Music & Arts

4626 Wedgewood Bivd.
Frederick, MD 21703
Louis Luzzi, School Bids Coordinator
Phone: (301) 620-4040
Fax: (301) 663-7754

Item Description (E):; Nllj :ai;;’:e Unit Cost Total Amount Unit Cost Total Amount
8.3.1. | Piano Tuning 170 | EACH $65.00 $11,050.00 No Bid
8.3.2. | Piano Repair 35 HOUR $20.00 $700.00 No Bid
Grand Total Amount (Pianos) $11,750.00 NO BID
% Discount off Manufacturers List Price 25% NO BID




