PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS B?gcﬁe?rUbgf rigtij?tgsl"-g;c.
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Concoyrd f\’lH 03301
FERIGIBIEL SUESERIPIoh) SERHIEED Janice Mclntyre Gover,nment Accounts Manager
s et Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
T Bidder’s Annual Cover = Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.1. AIMS 4 277554 $38.45 2% Service Charge $39.22
7.1.2. AMERICAN GIRL 6 277555 $25.25 2% Service Charge $25.75
7.1.3. ASIAN WEEK 50 277556 $75.90 2% Service Charge $77.42
7.1.4. ATLANTIC MONTHLY 10 277557 $24.95 2% Service Charge $25.45
7.1.5. AUTOMUNDO 11 277558 $21.95 2% Service Charge $22.39
7.1.6. BLACK ENTERPRISE 12 277559 $24.20 2% Service Charge $24.68
71.7. BMX PLUS 12 277560 $21.98 2% Service Charge $22.42
7.1.8. BOOKLIST 22 277561 $114.50 2% Service Charge $116.79
7.1.9. BOY'S LIFE 12 277562 $26.40 2% Service Charge $26.93
7.1.10. BRIDES 6 277563 $20.00 2% Service Charge $20.40
7.1.11. CALLIOPE 9 277565 $37.35 2% Service Charge $38.10
7.1.12. CAR & DRIVER 12 277566 $24.20 2% Service Charge $24.68
7.1.13. CAT FANCY 12 277567 $15.00 2% Service Charge $15.30
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS B?Scphe?rw;f rigtij?tgsl"-g;c.
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Con yrd KIH 03301
FERIGIBIEL SUESERIPIoh) SERHIEED Janice MclntyreoGZ(\)/er’nment Accounts Manager
s et Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
T Bidder’s Annual Cover = Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.14, COBBLESTONE 9 277568 $37.35 2% Service Charge $38.10
7.1.15, gg;‘gg#"SER 13 277569 $26.00 2% Service Charge $26.52
7.1.16. CRINKLES 6 277570 $33.00 2% Service Charge $33.66
7.1.17. CURRENT HEALTH 1 8 277571 $50.29 2% Service Charge $51.30
7.1.18. DIRT BIKE 12 277572 $19.98 2% Service Charge $20.38
7.1.19. DISCOVER 12 277573 $29.95 2% Service Charge $30.55
7.1.20. DISCOVERY GIRLS 6 277574 $21.95 2% Service Charge $22.39
7.1.21. DOGS FOR KIDS 6 277575 $30.79 2% Service Charge $31.41
7.1.22. EBONY 12 277576 $17.00 2% Service Charge $17.34
7.1.23. EDUCATION DIGEST 9 277577 $48.00 2% Service Charge $48.96
7.1.24. ESL MAGAZINE 6 277578 $60.50 2% Service Charge $61.71
7.1.25. ESPN DEPORTES 11 277579 $36.30 2% Service Charge $37.03
7.1.26. FACES 9 277580 $37.35 2% Service Charge $38.10
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Basch S“bgf”g“‘?t”%gc-
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Eaba by
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES ) eLicee,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Janice Mclintyre, Government Accounts Manager
BID TABULP:TION #1 Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of Sleo AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu-aI Order
Issues Item Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
7.1.27. FRANCE TODAY 6 277581 $66.00 2% Service Charge $67.32
7.1.28, C\'/ENMEESNS FOR 12 277668 $21.98 2% Service Charge $22.42
7.1.29. GAMEPRO 12 277582 $36.27 2% Service Charge $37.00
7.1.30. GIRLS'’ LIFE 6 277583 $15.97 2% Service Charge $16.29
7.1.31, F';ﬁ“é'éiws FOR 12 277584 $45.14 2% Service Charge $46.04
7.1.32. HISPANIC 10 277585 $19.80 2% Service Charge $20.20
7.1.33. HISPANIC BUSINESS 10 277586 $20.87 2% Service Charge $21.29
7.1.34. HYPHEN 4 277669 $38.50 2% Service Charge $39.27
7.1.35. IMAGES DOC 12 277670 $203.30 2% Service Charge $207.37
7.1.36. INSTRUCTOR 8 277587 $14.95 2% Service Charge $15.25
7.1.37. INSTRUMENTALIST 12 277588 $23.10 2% Service Charge $23.56
7.1.38. ISLAMICA 6 Suspended $0.00 $0.00
7.1.39. JACK & JILL 6 277589 $21.95 2% Service Charge $22.39
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS B?SC;‘ S“bgf”g“‘?t”%gc-
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 5 erry b %'3630 y
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES . oncord,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Janice Mclintyre, Government Accounts Manager
BID TABULP:TION #1 Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of Sleo AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu-aI Order
Issues Item Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
7.1.40, %‘ééNJSUST FOR 10 277590 $35.15 2% Service Charge $35.85
7.1.41. KIDS DISCOVER 12 277591 $26.95 2% Service Charge $27.49
7.1.42. LANGUAGE ARTS 6 277592 $90.00 2% Service Charge $91.80
7.1.43. LPN 6 277593 $131.96 2% Service Charge $134.60
7.1.44. MCRT(';A STEWART 12 277596 $25.00 2% Service Charge $25.50
7.1.45, M'IAIE)TSLEESACCHHg\(l)(I;_ IN 9 277597 $119.90 2% Service Charge $122.30
7.1.46. MENS FITNESS 10 277598 $16.47 2% Service Charge $16.80
7.1.47, Tg%%hifmoo" 5 277599 $60.50 2% Service Charge $61.71
7.1.48. MOTOR TREND 12 277600 $19.80 2% Service Charge $20.20
7.1.49. M DL TURAL 4 277601 $72.60 2% Service Charge $74.05
7.1.50. MUSE 9 277602 $37.35 2% Service Charge $38.10
7.1.51. MUSLIM GIRL 6 277603 $38.45 2% Service Charge $39.22
7.1.52, gégggﬁlﬁm cs 12 277604 $34.00 2% Service Charge $34.68
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Basch S“bgf”g“‘?t”%gc-
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 5 erry b %'3630 y
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES ) oncorc,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Janice Mclintyre, Government Accounts Manager
BID TABULP:TION #1 Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of Sleo AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu-aI Order
Issues Item Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
7.1.53, EfBTsL GEOGRAPHIC 10 277605 $19.95 2% Service Charge $20.35
7.1.54, NEWSWEEK 54 277606 $45.19 2% Service Charge $46.09
7.1.55. UE‘;VRE?\]F;K TIMES 14 277607 $45.05 2% Service Charge $45.95
7.1.56. NICKELODEON 10 277608 $21.97 2% Service Charge $22.41
7.1.57. NINTENDO POWER 14 277609 $38.45 2% Service Charge $39.22
7.1.58. ODYSSEY 9 277610 $32.95 2% Service Charge $33.61
7.1.59. PC WORLD 12 277611 $43.95 2% Service Charge $44.83
7.1.60. PEOPLE 53 277612 $141.77 2% Service Charge $144.61
7.1.61. EESAF’;%EN 11 277613 $38.47 2% Service Charge $39.24
7.1.62. ,\Pﬂ(égﬁ';\’?‘\ﬁcs 12 277614 $24.00 2% Service Charge $24.48
7.1.63, ﬁgg%’g&APHY 12 277615 $31.90 2% Service Charge $32.54
7.1.64. POPULAR SCIENCE 12 277616 $38.45 2% Service Charge $39.22
7.1.65. QUE TAL? 6 277617 $49.45 2% Service Charge $50.44
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Basch S“bgf”g“‘?t”%gc-
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Eaba by
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES ) oncorc,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Janice Mclintyre, Government Accounts Manager
BID TABULP:TION #1 Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of Sleo AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu-aI Order
Issues Item Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
7.1.66. READING TEACHER 8 277618 $156.00 2% Service Charge $159.12
7.1.67. RANGER RICK 12 277619 $19.95 2% Service Charge $20.35
7.1.68. REPORTERO DOC 11 277621 $195.56 2% Service Charge $199.47
7.1.69. SOy IBRARY 12 277622 $142.99 2% Service Charge $145.85
7.1.70. SO o RARY 10 277623 $60.50 2% Service Charge $61.71
7.1.71. SCIENCE TEACHER 8 277624 $92.40 2% Service Charge $94.25
7.1.72. SCOOBY DOO 12 277625 $22.00 2% Service Charge $22.44
7.1.73. SEVENTEEN 12 277626 $19.95 2% Service Charge $20.35
7.1.74. SHOJO BEAT 12 277627 $54.99 2% Service Charge $56.09
7.1.75. SHONEN JUMP 12 277628 $49.45 2% Service Charge $50.44
7.1.76. SKIPPING STONES 5 277629 $55.00 2% Service Charge $56.10
7.1.77. SOCCER AMERICA 12 277630 $103.40 2% Service Charge $105.47
7.1.78. R ATED 56 277631 $114.44 2% Service Charge $116.73
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS B?Scﬁe?fbéf rigtij?tgsl"-g;c.
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Con yrd KIH 03301
FERIGIBIEL SUESERIPIoh) SERHIEED Janice MclntyreoG(;(\)/er’nment Accounts Manager
s et Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
T Bidder’s Annual Cover = Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.79. ﬁ_PLSgFS{ ATED KIDS 12 277632 $43.95 2% Service Charge $44.83
7.1.80. TEACHER LIBRARIAN 5 277633 $71.50 2% Service Charge $72.93
7.1.81. TEEN VOGUE 10 277634 $10.00 2% Service Charge $10.20
7.1.82. TIME MAGAZINE 56 277635 $70.40 2% Service Charge $71.81
7.1.83. TIME FOR KIDS 18 277636 $49.45 2% Service Charge $50.44
7.1.84. UN CHRONICLE 4 277637 $27.50 2% Service Charge $28.05
7.1.85. UTNE READER 6 277638 $38.47 2% Service Charge $39.24
7.1.86. VEGETARIAN TIMES 10 277639 $21.95 2% Service Charge $22.39
7.1.87. VOGUE 12 277640 $29.95 2% Service Charge $30.55
7.1.88. WRITER’S DIGEST 10 277641 $19.96 2% Service Charge $20.36
7.1.89, ;ggEYEXSD 12 277642 $19.94 2% Service Charge $20.35
7.1.90. ZOOBOOKS 12 277643 $25.25 2% Service Charge $25.75
Grand Total Amount - Bidder’s Annual Subscription Price $4,325.94

10/08, Bid Tab 1, Page 7 of 40



PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION #1

Basch Subscriptions, Inc.
10 Ferry St., Suite 429
Concord, NH 03301
Janice Mclntyre, Government Accounts Manager
Phone: (703) 787-9810
Fax: (703) 787-9817

Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of Sleo AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu-aI Order
Item Code Subscription Price . Subscription Price N
Issues Price ( \ )
Payment Terms: Net 30 Days

Contractor shall provide a the name, address and telephone number
of the Customer Service Representative assigned to handle and
assist in any and all billing and problem solving that may arise
during the course of the contract.

Name: Christie Greenleaf

Address: 10 Ferry St., Ste. 429; Concord, NH 03301

Telephone #: 800-226-5310

Bidder(s) can provide the services indicated in Section 5: Yes/ No?
If no, please explain

If yes, bidder(s) shall submit a copy of the services provided no later
than the bid opening date; this may be a factor in making an award.

Yes

PRICING SCHEDULE

Sy Discount off Discount off Renewal
Item No Catalog Name, Expiration Date New Subscription Price Price
. No Discount No Discount
721 Basch Online Catalog 2% Service Charge 2% Service Charge
7.2.2.
7.2.3.
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘éox 201‘132’ c
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Fort .M.ers FL 33906
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Jasoyn DAy
D R o Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.1. AIMS 4 $21.95 0.00% $21.95
7.1.2. AMERICAN GIRL 6 $22.95 0.00% $22.95
7.1.3. ASIAN WEEK 50 $69.00 0.00% $69.00
7.1.4. ATLANTIC MONTHLY 10 $24.95 0.00% $24.95
Ceased 0
7.1.5. AUTOMUNDO 11 Publishing $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.6. BLACK ENTERPRISE 12 $14.95 0.00% $14.95
7.1.7. BMX PLUS 12 $19.98 0.00% $19.98
7.1.8. BOOKLIST 22 $99.50 0.00% $99.50
7.1.9. BOY’S LIFE 12 $24.00 0.00% $24.00
7.1.10. BRIDES 6 $11.97 0.00% $11.97
7.1.11. CALLIOPE 9 $33.95 0.00% $33.95
7.1.12. CAR & DRIVER 12 $10.97 0.00% $10.97
7.1.13. CAT FANCY 12 $15.00 0.00% $15.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘é N 201‘132’ c
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Fort .M.erg FL 33906
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Jasoyn DAy
A sl Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.14. COBBLESTONE 9 $33.95 0.00% $33.95
CONSUMER o
7.1.15. REPORTS 13 $26.00 0.00% $26.00
7.1.16. CRINKLES 6 $36.00 0.00% $36.00
7.1.17. CURRENT HEALTH 1 8 $37.95 0.00% $37.95
7.1.18. DIRT BIKE 12 $19.98 0.00% $19.98
7.1.19. DISCOVER 12 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.20. DISCOVERY GIRLS 6 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.21. DOGS FOR KIDS 6 $12.99 0.00% $12.99
7.1.22. EBONY 12 $12.95 0.00% $12.95
7.1.23. EDUCATION DIGEST 9 $48.00 0.00% $48.00
7.1.24. ESL MAGAZINE 6 $49.95 0.00% $49.95
7.1.25. ESPN DEPORTES 11 $18.00 0.00% $18.00
7.1.26. FACES 9 $33.95 0.00% $33.95
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION #2

Discount Magazine
Subscription Service, Inc.
P.O. Box 60114
Fort Myers, FL 33906
Jason Belfer, VP
Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557

porodcal | Nocor | Satere | amustcener | S ebenton | gpicersanual | orde
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.27. FRANCE TODAY 6 $50.00 0.00% $50.00
7.1.28. oy TR 12 $11.97 0.00% $11.97
7.1.29. GAMEPRO 12 $24.95 0.00% $24.95
7.1.30. GIRLS' LIFE 6 $14.95 0.00% $14.95
7.1.31. RIoFLICHTS FOR 12 $29.64 0.00% $29.64
7.1.32. HISPANIC 10 $16.00 0.00% $16.00
7.1.33. HISPANIC BUSINESS | 10 $12.00 0.00% $12.00
7.1.34. HYPHEN 4 $21.95 0.00% $21.95
7.1.35. IMAGES DOC 12 $144.00 0.00% $144.00
7.1.36. INSTRUCTOR 8 $14.95 0.00% $14.95
7.1.37. INSTRUMENTALIST 12 $22.00 0.00% $22.00
7.1.38, ISLAMICA 6 Ceased $0.00 0.00% $0.00
Publishing
7.1.39. JACK & JILL 6 $18.95 0.00% $18.95
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘é N 201‘132’ C.
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES . 'M'er‘; Ei,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Jasoyn DAy
BID TABULATION #2 Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover . .- Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.40. %‘ééNJSUST FOR 10 $14.97 0.00% $14.97
7.1.41, KIDS DISCOVER 12 $17.95 0.00% $17.95
7.1.42. LANGUAGE ARTS 6 $80.00 0.00% $80.00
7.1.43, LPN 6 $23.90 0.00% $23.90
7.1.44. MCRT(';A STEWART 12 $24.00 0.00% $24.00
MATH TEACHING IN .
7.1.45, MIDDLE SCHOOL 9 $104.00 0.00% $104.00
7.1.46. MENS FITNESS 10 $14.97 0.00% $14.97
7.147. ﬁ’gz%ifmoo'- 5 $42.00 0.00% $42.00
7.1.48. MOTOR TREND 12 $10.00 0.00% $10.00
7.1.49. 'Q{"ILEJ\';E\?VULTURAL 4 $74.00 0.00% $74.00
7.1.50. MUSE 9 $33.95 0.00% $33.95
7.1.51. MUSLIM GIRL 6 $26.00 0.00% $26.00
NATIONAL .
7.1.52. GEOGRAPHICS 12 $34.00 0.00% $34.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘é N 201‘132’ C.
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES . 'M'er‘; Ei,
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Jasoyn DAy
BID TABULATION #2 Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover . .- Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.53. EfBTsL GEOGRAPHIC 10 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.54., NEWSWEEK 54 $40.00 0.00% $40.00
7.1.55. UE‘;VRE?\]F;K TIMES 14 $14.95 0.00% $14.95
7.1.56. NICKELODEON 10 $19.97 0.00% $19.97
7.1.57. NINTENDO POWER 14 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.58. ODYSSEY 9 $33.95 0.00% $33.95
7.1.59. PC WORLD 12 $24.95 0.00% $24.95
7.1.60. PEOPLE 53 $116.07 0.00% $116.07
7.1.61. EESAF’;%EN 11 $14.97 0.00% $14.97
POPULAR .
7.1.62. MECHANICS 12 $24.00 0.00% $24.00
POPULAR .
7.1.63. PHOTOGRAPHY 12 $11.97 0.00% $11.97
7.1.64. POPULAR SCIENCE 12 $15.94 0.00% $15.94
7.1.65. QUE TAL? 6 $31.25 0.00% $31.25
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘é N 201‘132’ c
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES F rt.M. ro FL 33906
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. 0 Jasoynegé i
A sl Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.66. READING TEACHER 8 $141.00 0.00% $141.00
7.1.67. RANGER RICK 12 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.68. REPORTERO DOC 11 $144.00 0.00% $144.00
SCHOOL LIBRARY
7.1.69. JOURNAL 12 $129.99 0.00% $129.99
SCHOOL LIBRARY o
7.1.70. MEDIA ACTIVITY 10 $55.00 0.00% $55.00
7.1.71. SCIENCE TEACHER 8 $84.00 0.00% $84.00
7.1.72. SCOOBY DOO 12 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.73. SEVENTEEN 12 $12.00 0.00% $12.00
7.1.74. SHOJO BEAT 12 $39.95 0.00% $39.95
7.1.75. SHONEN JUMP 12 $34.95 0.00% $34.95
7.1.76. SKIPPING STONES 5 $39.00 0.00% $39.00
71.77. SOCCER AMERICA 12 $79.00 0.00% $79.00
SPORTS 0
7.1.78. ILLUSTRATED 56 $39.95 0.00% $39.95

10/08, Bid Tab 2, Page 14 of 40



PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eisﬁogna'\g"‘?\f‘iZi”ﬁn
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 u S; g ‘é N 201‘132’ c.
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES E rt.M.erg FL 33906
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. 0 Jasoyn DAy
D R o Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
SPORTS 0
7.1.79. ILLUSTRATED KIDS 12 $31.95 0.00% $31.95
7.1.80. TEACHER LIBRARIAN 5 $59.00 0.00% $59.00
7.1.81. TEEN VOGUE 10 $10.00 0.00% $10.00
7.1.82. TIME MAGAZINE 56 $29.95 0.00% $29.95
$32.95 — 1 copy
7.1.83. TIME FOR KIDS 18 $32.95 0.00% $5.30-10o0r
more copies
7.1.84. UN CHRONICLE 4 $25.00 0.00% $25.00
7.1.85. UTNE READER 6 $14.97 0.00% $14.97
7.1.86. VEGETARIAN TIMES 10 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.87. VOGUE 12 $17.97 0.00% $17.97
7.1.88. WRITER'’S DIGEST 10 $19.96 0.00% $19.96
YOUR BIG 0
7.1.89. BACKYARD 12 $19.95 0.00% $19.95
7.1.90. ZOOBOOKS 12 $25.95 0.00% $25.95
Totals $3,154.15 0.00% $3,154.15

10/08, Bid Tab 2, Page 15 of 40



PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5 Eis".ot?”t '\gaga.zmel
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 BT Ny
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES A FOXFL T
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. 0 Jasoy:BSéI Py
Bl 22 Phone: 239-274-6868; Fax: 239-225-1557
Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of ItBlddgr S AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu?I Order
Issues em Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
Grand Total Amount - Bidder’s Annual Subscription Price $3,154.15
Payment Terms: Net 90
Name: Discount Magazine; Subscription Service, Inc.
Contractor shall provide a the name, address and telephone number
of the Customer Service Representative assigned to handle and Address: P.O. Box 60114; Fort Myers, FL 33906
assist in any and all billing and problem solving that may arise
during the course of the contract. Telephone #:
Bidder(s) can provide the services indicated in Section 5: Yes/ No?
If no, please explain Yes
If yes, bidder(s) shall submit a copy of the services provided no later
than the bid opening date; this may be a factor in making an award.
PRICING SCHEDULE
Sy Discount off Discount off Renewal
Item No Catalog Name, Expiration Date New Subscription Price Price
7.2.1
7.2.2.
7.2.3.
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angeles. CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES - gime;]t Director
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. Ph - ’ 247
BID TABULATION #3 OIS b5
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.1. AIMS 4 Almne01 $19.95 8% $18.35
7.1.2. AMERICAN GIRL 6 AMGO01 $22.95 8% $21.11
7.1.3. ASIAN WEEK 50 awm1 $29.00 8% $26.68
7.1.4. ATLANTIC MONTHLY 10 ATMO01J $24.95 8% $22.95
7.1.5. AUTOMUNDO 11 AUMO1 $19.95 8% $18.35
7.1.6. BLACK ENTERPRISE 12 BLNO1 $16.95 8% $15.59
7.1.7. BMX PLUS 12 BMXUSO01 $19.99 8% $18.39
7.1.8. BOOKLIST 22 BOOKL1 $99.95 8% $91.95
7.1.9. BOY’S LIFE 12 BOL0O1Q $24.00 8% $22.08
7.1.10. BRIDES 6 BRIO1R $11.97 8% $11.01
7.1.11. CALLIOPE 9 CALLIO1 $33.95 8% $31.23
7.1.12. CAR & DRIVER 12 CDRO1R $11.97 8% $11.01
7.1.13. CAT FANCY 12 CAY01R $15.00 8% $13.80
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
L el Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.14. COBBLESTONE 9 Cobble1 $33.95 8% $31.23
CONSUMER
7.1.15. REPORTS 13 CRP0O1Q $26.00 8% $23.92
7.1.16. CRINKLES 6 CrinkO1r $36.00 8% $33.12
7.1.17. CURRENT HEALTH 1 8 CURIO1 $37.95 8% $34.91
7.1.18. DIRT BIKE 12 DIRKEO1 $19.99 8% $18.39
7.1.19. DISCOVER 12 DISO1W $24.95 8% $22.95
7.1.20. DISCOVERY GIRLS 6 DGRO1 $19.95 8% $18.35
7.1.21. DOGS FOR KIDS 6 dogKds01 $14.95 8% $13.75
7.1.22. EBONY 12 EBY01J $15.99 8% $14.71
7.1.23. EDUCATION DIGEST 9 EDUSTO1 $48.00 8% $44.16
7.1.24. ESL MAGAZINE 6 ESLMA1 $60.00 8% $55.20
7.1.25. ESPN DEPORTES 11 esel01 $24.00 8% $22.08
7.1.26. FACES 9 FACES1R $33.95 8% $31.23
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
L el Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.27. FRANCE TODAY 6 Francet1 $40.00 8% $36.80
FITNESS FOR o
7.1.28. WOMEN 12 FITO1 $13.97 8% $12.85
7.1.29. GAMEPRO 12 Gpr01 $21.97 8% $20.21
7.1.30. GIRLS’ LIFE 6 GLIO1 $14.95 8% $13.75
HIGHLIGHTS FOR N
7.1.31. CHILDREN 12 HighlighO1r $34.95 8% $32.15
7.1.32. HISPANIC 10 HIS01 $10.00 8% $9.20
7.1.33. HISPANIC BUSINESS 10 HISPBU1 $18.97 8% $17.45
7.1.34. HYPHEN 4 Hypen01 $18.00 8% $16.56
7.1.35. IMAGES DOC 12 Imaoc01 $90.00 8% $82.80
7.1.36. INSTRUCTOR 8 INTO1 $14.95 8% $13.75
7.1.37. INSTRUMENTALIST 12 Instrum1 $11.00 8% $10.12
7.1.38. ISLAMICA 6 ISLMCAO1 $29.95 8% $27.55
7.1.39. JACK & JILL 6 JAJO1J $18.95 8% $17.43
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
gg?f:&kﬁoooﬁ g 2:00 P.M. Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
- Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’'s Annual
LB e e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.40. %‘ééNJSUST FOR 10 J1401r $16.95 8% $15.59
7.1.41. KIDS DISCOVER 12 KDI01 $26.95 8% $24.79
7.1.42. LANGUAGE ARTS 6 lanO1r $95.00 8% $87.40
7.1.43. LPN 6 LPNO701 $23.90 8% $21.99
7.1.44, MCRT(';A STEWART 12 MALO1 $24.00 8% $22.08
MATH TEACHING IN . o
7.1.45. MIDDLE SCHOOL 9 MaTeinR1 $99.00 8% $91.08
7.1.46. MENS FITNESS 10 MEFO01 $14.97 8% $13.77
7.1.47. Tg%%hifmoo" 5 MSJ1R $45.00 8% $41.40
7.1.48. MOTOR TREND 12 MTDO1 $18.00 8% $16.56
7.1.49. 'Q{"ILEJ\';E\?VULTURAL 4 Mulew01 $60.00 8% $55.20
7.1.50. MUSE 9 MUSE1R $33.95 8% $31.23
7.1.51. MUSLIM GIRL 6 Musrl01 $19.99 8% $18.39
NATIONAL o
7.1.52. GEOGRAPHICS 12 NAGO01J $34.00 8% $31.28
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
gI%TTO :BESL::'I'ZIOOO: #@3 A Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
LB e INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.53, NS GEOGRAPHIC | 4 NGKO1 $17.95 8% $16.51
7.1.54. NEWSWEEK 54 NWSO01 $25.00 8% $23.00
NEW YORK TIMES 0
7.1.55. UPFRONT 14 NYTIMUF $24.95 8% $22.95
7.1.56. NICKELODEON 10 NCKO01 $19.97 8% $18.37
7.1.57. NINTENDO POWER 14 NTPO1 $21.95 8% $20.19
7.1.58. ODYSSEY 9 ODYSS1 $33.95 8% $31.23
7.1.59. PC WORLD 12 PCWO01 $24.95 8% $22.95
7.1.60. PEOPLE 53 PEOO1TT $135.00 8% $105.30
PEOPLE EN o
7.1.61. ESPANOL 11 plso1r $25.95 8% $23.87
POPULAR o
7.1.62. MECHANICS 12 POMO1T $11.00 8% $10.12
POPULAR o
7.1.63. PHOTOGRAPHY 12 POPO0O1J $20.00 8% $18.40
7.1.64. POPULAR SCIENCE 12 PCSO01 $19.95 8% $18.35
7.1.65. QUE TAL? 6 QUETAL1R $7.95 8% $7.31
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
L el Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.66. READING TEACHER 8 ReTeR1 $125.00 8% $115.00
7.1.67. RANGER RICK 12 RRI01 $16.50 8% $15.18
7.1.68. REPORTERO DOC 11 Repoc01 $112.00 8% $103.04
SCHOOL LIBRARY
7.1.69. JOURNAL 12 SCHLO1 $129.99 8% $119.59
SCHOOL LIBRARY o
7.1.70. MEDIA ACTIVITY 10 SlmamO1r $55.00 8% $50.60
7.1.71. SCIENCE TEACHER 8 SCITE1R $84.00 8% $77.28
7.1.72. SCOOBY DOO 12 SCDO01 $19.99 8% $19.99
7.1.73. SEVENTEEN 12 SEVO01 $12.00 8% $11.04
7.1.74. SHOJO BEAT 12 shojobe1 $34.99 8% $32.19
7.1.75. SHONEN JUMP 12 shojum1 $29.95 8% $27.55
7.1.76. SKIPPING STONES 5 skipsto01r $35.00 8% $32.20
7.1.77. SOCCER AMERICA 12 SOC01 $79.00 8% $72.68
SPORTS 0
7.1.78. ILLUSTRATED 56 SpOed1 $89.00 8% $81.88
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Gold Coast Services, Inc,
PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 5482 Wilshire Blvd., Ste. 260
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Los Angel CA 90036
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES J(;Sson g?nf;t S
L el Phone: 800-955-6247
Fax: 755-855-6247
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
SPORTS 0
7.1.79. ILLUSTRATED KIDS 12 SIKIDS1T $31.95 8% $29.39
7.1.80. TEACHER LIBRARIAN 5 TEALIBO1RR $50.00 8% $46.00
7.1.81. TEEN VOGUE 10 TVOO01 $15.00 8% $13.80
7.1.82. TIME MAGAZINE 56 Tim01 $49.00 8% $45.08
7.1.83. TIME FOR KIDS 18 Time4dkidse1 $43.00 8% $39.56
7.1.84. UN CHRONICLE 4 unchron1 $20.00 8% $18.40
7.1.85. UTNE READER 6 UTRO1 $14.97 8% $13.77
7.1.86. VEGETARIAN TIMES 10 VTMO1 $11.95 8% $10.99
7.1.87. VOGUE 12 VOGO1T $15.00 8% $13.80
7.1.88. WRITER'’S DIGEST 10 WRDO1R $19.96 8% $18.36
YOUR BIG 0
7.1.89. BACKYARD 12 YBYO01 $15.00 8% $13.80
7.1.90. ZOOBOOKS 12 ZBO01 $25.95 8% $23.87
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Totals $3,118.40 $249.47 $2,868.93
Grand Total Amount - Bidder’s Annual Subscription Price $2,868.93
Payment Terms: Net 30

Name: Gold Coast Services, Inc.

Contractor shall provide a the name, address and telephone number of
the Customer Service Representative assigned to handle and assist in Address: 5482 Wilshire Blvd., #260; Los Angeles, CA 90036
any and all billing and problem solving that may arise during the course
of the contract. Telephone #: 323-965-9565

Bidder(s) can provide the services indicated in Section 5: Yes/ No? If
no, please explain

If yes, bidder(s) shall submit a copy of the services provided no later
than the bid opening date; this may be a factor in making an award.

PRICING SCHEDULE

e Discount off Discount off Renewal
Item No Catalog Name, Expiration Date New Subscription Price Price
7.2.1 Gold Coast Periodical Price List 8% 8%
7.2.2.
7.2.3.
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;(')}é?%?ggrlpgﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 - NJ60807§
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. iz, P
BID TABULATION #4 Phone: 800-446-3355
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
YT Bidder’s Annual Cover - Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
711, AIMS 4 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.2. AMERICAN GIRL 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.3. ASIAN WEEK 50 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
71.4. ATLANTIC MONTHLY 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.5. AUTOMUNDO 11 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.6. BLACK ENTERPRISE 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
71.7. BMX PLUS 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.8. BOOKLIST 22 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.9. BOY'S LIFE 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.10. BRIDES 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7111, CALLIOPE 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.12. CAR & DRIVER 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.13. CAT FANCY 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00

10/08, Bid Tab 4, Page 25 of 40



PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Weeé‘%?‘é?gj;lpgﬁcghmg
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Delran. NJ 08075
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. 80044 b
BID TABULATION #4 P ienEn EOlAEbEe
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.14. COBBLESTONE 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
CONSUMER o
7.1.15. REPORTS 13 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.16. CRINKLES 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
10+ copies
7.1.17. CURRENT HEALTH 1 8 CH1 $22.50 $11.28 per issue $22.50 N
7.1.18. DIRT BIKE 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.19. DISCOVER 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.20. DISCOVERY GIRLS 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.21. DOGS FOR KIDS 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.22. EBONY 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.23. EDUCATION DIGEST 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.24. ESL MAGAZINE 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.25. ESPN DEPORTES 11 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.26. FACES 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;é}g?%?ggrlpgﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Delran Nf0807§
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. iz, b
BID TABULATION #4 Phone: 800-446-3355
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
T Bidder’s Annual Cover e Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.27. FRANCE TODAY 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.28. oy TR 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.29. GAMEPRO 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.30. GIRLS'’ LIFE 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
HIGHLIGHTS FOR o
7.1.31. CHILDREN 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.32. HISPANIC 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.33. HISPANIC BUSINESS 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.34. HYPHEN 4 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.35. IMAGES DOC 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.36. INSTRUCTOR 8 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.37. INSTRUMENTALIST 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.38. ISLAMICA 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.39. JACK & JILL 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;(')}é?%?ggrlpsﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Delran NJ60807§
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. 80044 b
BID TABULATION #4 P ienEn EOlAEbEe
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.40, %‘ééNJSUST FOR 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.41. KIDS DISCOVER 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.42. LANGUAGE ARTS 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.43. LPN 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.44. NoNe STEWART 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
MATH TEACHING IN o
7.1.45. MIDDLE SCHOOL 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.46. MENS FITNESS 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
MIDDLE SCHOOL 0
7.1.47. JOURNAL 5 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.48. MOTOR TREND 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.49, M DL TURAL 4 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.50. MUSE 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.51. MUSLIM GIRL 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
NATIONAL o
7.1.52. GEOGRAPHICS 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00

10/08, Bid Tab 4, Page 28 of 40



PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;é}&?%?ggrlpslﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Delran NfOSO?g
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. iz, b
BID TABULATION #4 Phone: 800-446-3355
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
T Bidder’s Annual Cover e Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.53. N GEOGRAPHIC 14 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.54. NEWSWEEK 54 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
NEW YORK TIMES o
7.1.55. UPFRONT 14 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.56. NICKELODEON 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.57. NINTENDO POWER 14 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.58. ODYSSEY 9 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.59. PC WORLD 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.60. PEOPLE 53 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
PEOPLE EN o
7.1.61. ESPANOL 11 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
POPULAR o
7.1.62. MECHANICS 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
POPULAR o
7.1.63. PHOTOGRAPHY 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.64. POPULAR SCIENCE 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.65. QUE TAL? 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;(')}é?%?ggrlpgﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 - NJ60807§
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. iz, b
BID TABULATION #4 Phone: 800-446-3355
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
YT Bidder’s Annual Cover - Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.66. READING TEACHER 8 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.67. RANGER RICK 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.68. REPORTERO DOC 11 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
SCHOOL LIBRARY
7.1.69. JOURNAL 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
SCHOOL LIBRARY o
7.1.70. MEDIA ACTIVITY 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.71. SCIENCE TEACHER 8 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.72. SCOOBY DOO 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.73. SEVENTEEN 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.74. SHOJO BEAT 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.75. SHONEN JUMP 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.76. SKIPPING STONES 5 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.77. SOCCER AMERICA 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
SPORTS 0
7.1.78. ILLUSTRATED 56 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Wee;(')}é?%?ggrlpgﬁ\llishing
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 - NJ60807§
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Cru’z Bid Specialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. iz, b
BID TABULATION #4 Phone: 800-446-3355
Fax: 856-786-3360
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
YT Bidder’s Annual Cover - Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
SPORTS 0
7.1.79. ILLUSTRATED KIDS 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.80. TEACHER LIBRARIAN 5 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.81. TEEN VOGUE 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.82. TIME MAGAZINE 56 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.83. TIME FOR KIDS 18 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.84. UN CHRONICLE 4 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.85. UTNE READER 6 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.86. VEGETARIAN TIMES 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.87. VOGUE 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.88. WRITER’S DIGEST 10 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
YOUR BIG 0
7.1.89. BACKYARD 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
7.1.90. ZOOBOOKS 12 NO BID $0.00 0.00% $0.00
Totals $22.50 0.00% $22.50
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Weeé‘%fg?‘dgrlpgt?“s’h'”g
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 o Irl]\lJGOSCT;/g

PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Sharon Gauy. Bid Socsialist
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. aron Lruz, Sic specialls

Phone: 800-446-3355
BID TABULATION #4 Fax: 856-786-3360

Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of ItBlddgr S AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu?I Order
Issues em Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
Grand Total Amount - Bidder’s Annual Subscription Price $22.50
Payment Terms:
Name: Customer Service
Contractor shall provide a the name, address and telephone number
of the Customer Service Representative assigned to handle and Address 3001 Cindel Dr.; Delran, NJ
assist in any and all billing and problem solving that may arise
during the course of the contract. Telephone #: 1-800-446-3355
Bidder(s) can provide the services indicated in Section 5: Yes/ No? Planning Calendar for Curriculum Planning
If no, please explain Extra activities online www.weeklyreader.com
If yes, bidder(s) shall submit a copy of the services provided no later | Teacher’s guide with every issue
than the bid opening date; this may be a factor in making an award. Classroom Newsbreak Emails

PRICING SCHEDULE

o Discount off Discount off Renewal
Item No Catalog Name, Expiration Date New Subscription Price Price
7.2.1
7.2.2.
7.2.3.
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Lo besl’;llS“bS;”ng”S
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Sl a,%% 2‘:3270
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Van Huah a Biri’c e B el
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hughes, 1
LA e Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover . .- Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.11. AIMS 4 6631 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.2. AMERICAN GIRL 6 26237 $22.95 17.00% $19.05
7.1.3. ASIAN WEEK 50 9503 $79.00 0.00% $79.00
7.1.4. ATLANTIC MONTHLY 10 1051 $29.95 17.00% $24.86
7.1.5. AUTOMUNDO 11 11456 Free 0.00% Free N
7.1.6. BLACK ENTERPRISE 12 1073 $22.00 17.00% $18.26
71.7. BMX PLUS 12 1075 $19.99 17.00% $16.59
7.1.8. BOOKLIST 22 1079 $99.50 0.00% $99.50
7.1.9. BOY’S LIFE 12 1082 $24.00 17.00% $19.92
7.1.10. BRIDES 6 43835 $20.00 17.00% $16.60
7.1.11. CALLIOPE 9 2316 $33.95 17.00% $28.18
7.1.12. CAR & DRIVER 12 1094 $22.00 17.00% $18.26
7.1.13. CAT FANCY 12 1096 $27.97 17.00% $23.22
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS L ch‘\’/’;”g“gs;gggons
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Shallotte I%IC 28470
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Van Huah Dir ’ctor of Contract Services
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hugnes, LJire
BID TABULATION #5 Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover .. Bidder’s Annual
Itom # el e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.14. COBBLESTONE 9 1120 $33.95 17.00% $28.18
CONSUMER o
7.1.15. REPORTS 13 1132 $29.00 17.00% $24.07
7.1.16. CRINKLES 6 80852 $36.00 17.00% $29.88
7.1.17. CURRENT HEALTH 1 8 1147 $37.95 0.00% $37.95
7.1.18. DIRT BIKE 12 1160 $19.99 17.00% $16.59
7.1.19. DISCOVER 12 1163 $34.95 17.00% $29.01
7.1.20. DISCOVERY GIRLS 6 94447 $23.00 17.00% $19.09
7.1.21. DOGS FOR KIDS 6 108530 $19.97 17.00% $16.58
7.1.22. EBONY 12 1172 $19.00 17.00% $15.77
7.1.23. EDUCATION DIGEST 9 1174 $48.00 17.00% $39.84
7.1.24. ESL MAGAZINE 6 80966 $65.00 17.00% $53.95
7.1.25. ESPN DEPORTES 11 111332 $18.00 17.00% $14.94
7.1.26. FACES 9 1190 $33.95 17.00% $28.18
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS i besl’;llS“bS;”ng”S
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Sl a,%% 2‘:3270
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Vanessa Huah a Bire’ e B el
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hughes, Lirec
BID TABULATION #5 Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
- Bidder’s Annual Cover . Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.27. FRANCE TODAY 6 105436 $45.00 $17.00% $37.35
FITNESS FOR o
7.1.28. WOMEN 12 30964 $19.98 17.00% $16.58
7.1.29. GAMEPRO 12 12681 $24.95 17.00% $20.71
7.1.30. GIRLS’ LIFE 6 34847 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
HIGHLIGHTS FOR o
7.1.31. CHILDREN 12 1239 $34.95 17.00% $29.01
7.1.32. HISPANIC 10 9231 $16.00 17.00% $13.28
7.1.33. HISPANIC BUSINESS 10 4434 $11.95 17.00% $9.92
7.1.34. HYPHEN 4 106712 $18.00 17.00% $14.94
7.1.35. IMAGES DOC 12 40973 $118.67 17.00% $98.50
7.1.36. INSTRUCTOR 8 1260 $21.95 17.00% $18.22
7.1.37. INSTRUMENTALIST 12 1261 $21.00 17.00% $17.43
7.1.38. ISLAMICA 6 115759 Suspended 0.00% Suspended
7.1.39. JACK & JILL 6 1266 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005

PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES

OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.
BID TABULATION #5

W. T. Cox Subscriptions

201 Village Road

Shallotte, NC 28470
Vanessa Hughes, Director of Contract Services
Phone: 800-571-9554

Fax: 877-755-6274

porodcal | Noor | Sadre | Amumconr | S Shaerion | oiders il | order
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.40. T SSTFOR 10 95845 $14.97 17.00% $12.43
7.1.41. KIDS DISCOVER 12 21688 $26.95 17.00% $22.37
7.1.42. LANGUAGE ARTS 6 1286 $75.00 17.00% $62.25
7.1.43. LPN 6 112254 $148.96 17.00% $123.64
7.1.44. oG STEWART 12 23062 $28.00 17.00% $23.24
7.1.45. ) EACHIS IN 9 30954 $104.00 17.00% $86.32
7.1.46. MENS FITNESS 10 7326 $21.97 17.00% $18.24
7.1.47. o OOk 5 1310 $40.00 17.00% $33.20
7.1.48. MOTOR TREND 12 1324 $10.00 17.00% $8.30
7.1.49. M DL TURAL 4 24426 $69.00 17.00% $57.27
7.1.50. MUSE 9 46988 $33.95 17.00% $28.18
7.1.51. MUSLIM GIRL 6 126573 Suspended 0.00% Suspended
7.1.52, NATIONAL 12 1335 $34.00 17.00% $28.22

GEOGRAPHICS
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Lo besl’;llS“bS;”pgms
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Sl a,%% 2‘:3370
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Van Huah a Bire’ e B el
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hugnes, Lirec
LA e Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover . .- Bidder’'s Annual
LB e e € Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
Issues Price ( \ )
7.1.53. EfBTsL GEOGRAPHIC 10 1336 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.54. NEWSWEEK 54 1355 $42.00 17.00% $34.86
NEW YORK TIMES .
7.1.55. UPFRONT 14 83302 $28.29 0.00% $28.29
7.1.56. NICKELODEON 10 30102 $29.99 17.00% $24.89
7.1.57. NINTENDO POWER 14 10988 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.58. ODYSSEY 9 1363 $33.95 17.00% $28.18
7.1.59. PC WORLD 12 1375 $24.95 17.00% $20.71
7.1.60. PEOPLE 53 109102 $116.07 17.00% $96.34
PEOPLE EN .
7.1.61. ESPANOL 11 50831 $19.97 17.00% $16.58
POPULAR .
7.1.62. MECHANICS 12 1388 $24.00 17.00% $19.92
POPULAR .
7.1.63. PHOTOGRAPHY 12 1389 $24.00 17.00% $19.92
7.1.64. POPULAR SCIENCE 12 1390 $19.97 17.00% $16.58
7.1.65. QUE TAL? 6 20092 $32.65 0.00% $32.65
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Lo besl’;llS“bS;”pgms
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Sl a,%% 2‘:3370
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Van Huah a Bire’ e B el
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hugnes, Lirecto
LA e Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
. Bidder’s Annual Cover . .- Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
7.1.66. READING TEACHER 8 1402 $141.00 0.00% $141.00
7.1.67. RANGER RICK 12 1399 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.68. REPORTERO DOC 11 82895 $127.58 $17.00% $105.89
SCHOOL LIBRARY
7.1.69. SOURNAL 12 1417 $129.99 0.00% $129.99
SCHOOL LIBRARY
7.1.70. MEDIA ACTIVITY 10 1418 $55.00 17.00% $45.65
7.1.71. SCIENCE TEACHER 8 1429 $84.00 0.00% $84.00
7.1.72. SCOOBY DOO 12 87837 $20.00 17.00% $16.60
7.1.73. SEVENTEEN 12 1434 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.74. SHOJO BEAT 12 109521 $34.99 17.00% $29.04
7.1.75. SHONEN JUMP 12 102271 $29.95 17.00% $24.86
7.1.76. SKIPPING STONES 5 12360 $35.00 17.00% $29.05
7.1.77. SOCCER AMERICA 12 5375 $79.00 17.00% $65.57
SPORTS
7.1.78. L LUSTRATED 56 109112 $88.95 17.00% $73.83
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS R besl’;llS“bS;”ng”S
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005 Sl a,%% 2‘:3270
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES Van Huah a Bire’ e B el
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M. anessa Hugnes, Lirec
BID TABULATION #5 Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274
Annual . Bidder’s % Disc Off . Direct
- Bidder’s Annual Cover . Bidder’'s Annual
Itom # el INO' ol Item Code Subscription Price (AT SL!bSCI'Iptlon Subscription Price 9{",‘?’
ssues Price ( \ )
SPORTS
7.1.79. ILLUSTRATED KIDS 12 9571 $31.95 17.00% $26.52
7.1.80. TEACHER LIBRARIAN 5 80196 $54.00 17.00% $44.82
7.1.81. TEEN VOGUE 10 100837 $15.00 17.00% $12.45
7.1.82. TIME MAGAZINE 56 109113 $76.13 17.00% $63.19
7.1.83. TIME FOR KIDS 18 81517 $4.10 0.00% $41.00
7.1.84. UN CHRONICLE 4 1487 $25.00 17.00% $20.75
7.1.85. UTNE READER 6 104395 $19.97 17.00% $16.58
7.1.86. VEGETARIAN TIMES 10 5875 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.87. VOGUE 12 1497 $29.95 17.00% $24.86
7.1.88. WRITER’S DIGEST 10 1522 $19.96 17.00% $16.57
YOUR BIG o
7.1.89. BACKYARD 12 1526 $19.95 17.00% $16.56
7.1.90. ZOOBOOKS 12 1527 $25.95 17.00% $21.54
Totals $3,462.18 $588.57 $2,873.61
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W. T. Cox Subscriptions
201 Village Road
Shallotte, NC 28470
Vanessa Hughes, Director of Contract Services
Phone: 800-571-9554
Fax: 877-755-6274

PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-9005
PERIODICAL SUBSCRIPTION SERVICES
OCTOBER 7, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION #5

Annual . , Bidder’s % Disc Off . , Direct
Item # Periodical No. of ItBlddgr S AnnL_|aI_Cove|: Annual Subscription B'dde.' s_Annu?I Order
Issues em Code Subscription Price Price Subscription Price (“\/,,)
Grand Total Amount - Bidder’s Annual Subscription Price $2,873.61
Payment Terms: Net 30 Days
Name: Mary Brasfield
Contractor shall provide a the name, address and telephone number
of the Customer Service Representative assigned to handle and Address 201 Village Road; Shallotte, NC 28470
assist in any and all billing and problem solving that may arise
during the course of the contract. Telephone #: 800-571-9554 / 910-754-3145 Ext. 213
Bldder(s) can prov_lde the services Indicated|in' Section’5: Yes/ No7 Yes. Please see the attached narrative responses to Section 5.
If no, please explain
If yes, bidder(s) shall submit a copy of the services provided no later
than the bid opening date; this may be a factor in making an award.

PRICING SCHEDULE

Sy Discount off Discount off Renewal
Item No Catalog Name, Expiration Date New Subscription Price Price
Please see list of
7.2.1 W. T. Cox Subscriptions 2008 catalog, expires 12/31/2008 exceptions 17.00%
17.00%
7.2.2.
7.2.3.
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