Bid Tabulation
RNM-9000
Cafeteria Smallwares
August 7, 2008
Nancy Markov, Buyer

703-791-8742; FAX: 703-791-7462

Acme Paper & Supply
James Brener, Account
Representative
8229 Sandy Ct.

P.O. Box 422
Savage, MD 20763
Phone: 800-462-5812 ext. 1267
Fax: 410-792-2137

Buller Fixture
Eileen T. Newton, Sales
Manager
6828 L St.
Omaha, NE 68117
Phone: 800-444-2601-112
Fax: 402-592-0763

Calico Industries, Inc.
Michael L. Heverly, Sr.,
Dir./Bids & Contracts
9045 Junction Drive
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701
Phone: 800-638-0828
Fax: 301-575-0131

Eastern Bag & Paper

Company, Inc.
John Kennedy, Territory Sales
Manager

P.O. Box 591

New Market, MD 21774

Phone: 301-712-7988

Fax: 800-643-5905

Unit Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price &
Item D . Est. of brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total
# P Qty. I other than Price other than Price other than Price other than Price
ssue iee iee iee iee
specified) specified) specified) specified)
Bin, ingredient Cambro #IB36, 34
1. gallons with sliding lid 20 EA $178.20 $3,564.00 $172.60 $3,452.00 $176.58 $3,531.60 $191.16 $3.823.20
Board, cutting 12" x 18" Katchall,
2. Poly-Slice #CB-12181% 36 EA $10.66 $383.76 $7.97 $286.92 $10.29 $370.44 $10.28 $370.08
Bowl, mixing 1'% quart, SS,
3. Vollrath #69014 8 EA $7.05 $56.40 $7.37 $58.96 $7.65 $61.20 $7.71 $61.68
4. | B, mixing 4 quart, SS Vollrath 1 EA $10.64 $10.64 $11.10 $11.10 $11.59 $11.59 $11.63 $11.63
5. | Sou, mixing 8 quart, S Volrath 13 EA $17.06 $221.78 $17.64 $229.32 $18.57 $241.41 $18.64 $242.32
Bowl, mixing w/stand 30 quart, SS
6. Vollrath #7930-1 1 EA $592.43 $592.43 $636.00 $636.00 $609.69 $609.69 $647.29 $647.29
Bowl, salad 8", Vollrath #52869,
7. sold 48/case 696 EA $2.43 $1,691.28 $2.76 $1,920.96 $2.57 $1,788.72 $2.66 $1,851.36
Bowl, salad, 18", 19.2 quart
8. capacity, clear plastic pebbled 1 EA $17.74 $17.74 $15.83 $15.83 $16.03 $16.03 $19.21 $18,921.60
design, Cambro #PSB18
Bowl, soup rim nappie 14-15
9. ounce, assorted colors, Cambro 960 EA $1.46 $1,401.60 $1.69 $1,622.40 $1.23 $1,180.80 $1.59 $1,526.40
#50CW
Box, food storage clear plastic
10. | w/lid, 18" x 12" x 6" deep, Cambro 36 EA $17.37 $625.32 $18.63 $670.68 $18.29 $658.44 $22.33 $803.88
#12186CW, w/#1218CCW lid
Box, food storage clear plastic
11. | w/lid 18" x 26" x 6" deep, Cambro 12 EA $33.23 $398.76 $35.07 $420.84 $36.10 $433.20 $42.72 $512.64
#18226CW, w/#1826CCW lid
Brush, dishwasher machine, 24",
12. | nylon bristles anchored in steel 5 EA $11.23 $56.15 $8.97 $44.85 $9.94 $49.70 $12.13 $60.65
wire, Carlisle #40159
Brush, kettle, with 20" handle,
13. | Carlisle brush #40040 w/handle 8 EA $22.53 $180.24 $20.35 $162.80 $20.54 $164.32 $8.35 $66.80
#40230
14, | Srush, kettle drain valve, Carlisle 6 EA $3.82 $22.92 $3.52 $21.12 $3.64 $21.84 $4.39 $26.34
Brush, pan lip, plastic block
15. | handle, stiff 1" bristles, Carlisle 6 EA $3.66 $21.96 $3.34 $20.04 $3.78 $22.68 $4.21 $25.26
#40024
Brush, pastry, plastic handle,
16. nylon bristles. Carlisle #40393 40 EA $7.31 $292.40 $6.19 $247.60 $6.70 $268.00 $8.41 $336.40
Brush, vegetable, plastic handle,
17. | nylon bristles set in heavy gauge 14 EA $5.54 $77.56 $4.86 $68.04 $5.71 $79.94 $6.37 $89.18
steel wire, Carlisle #40164
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18. Caddy, Rack, Caddy Model #T-20 10 EA $415.15 $4,151.50 $412.76 $4,127.60 $384.00 $3,840.00 $434.83 $4,348.30
19. Caddy, Tray, Caddy Model #T-40 10 EA $409.45 $4,094.50 $412.76 $4,127.60 $384.00 $3,840.00 $434.83 $4.348.30
20. g;g(so"e”er' electric, Edlund 1 EA $524.80 $524.80 $459.50 $459.50 $488.67 $488.67 $548.70 $548.70
21. | Can Opener, manual, Edlund #1 6 EA $116.67 $700.02 $79.77 $478.62 $89.10 $534.60 $94.99 $569.94
Chafer, oblong, Vollrath #46880,
. 1
20, | toinclude 2%-inch food pan, 6 EA $186.62 $1,119.72 $194.72 $1,168.32 $202.90 $1,217.40 $203.90 $1,223.40
dripless water pan, dome cover
and 2 fuel holders
Colander, 16 quart, Wearever
23. #4616 1 EA $75.65 $75.65 $64.54 $64.54 $69.07 $69.07 $82.66 $82.66
Crock, plain with lid, 1.2 quart,
24. white, Cambro #ECP12 50 EA $3.06 $153.00 $3.19 $159.50 $3.37 $168.50 $3.93 $196.50
Crock, plain with lid, white, 2.7
25. quart, Cambro #CP27 30 EA $4.34 $130.20 $4.52 $135.60 $4.78 $143.40 $5.02 $150.60
26. Cutter, dough, Mundial #W 5697 60 EA $6.08 $364.80 $6.24 $374.40 $5.36 $321.60 $8.85 $531.00
o7, | Gutter, dough 5 wheel marker, 30 EA $10.69 $320.70 $19.10 $573.00 $16.75 $502.50 Admsisga7|'c7:£r1aft # | $532.20
" | Admiral Craft #ADD-5WH ’ ’ Halco 2225 ’ ’ ’ ’
ADD-6WH
Cutter, pizza, 4" diameter,
28. | stainless steel blade, American 60 EA $3.99 $239.40 $2.11 $126.60 $4.71 $282.60 $4.25 $255.00
Metalcraft #PPC-4
Dipper, 30 ounce aluminum, $34.03
29. Wearever #5330 3 EA $40.28 $120.84 Lincoln S330 $102.09 $37.10 $111.30 $44.01 $132.03
30, | Cutectio cover, 12 207, Vollrath 6 EA $130.98 $785.88 $135.85 $815.10 $136.16 $816.96 $143.11 $858.66
31, | FirstAid Kit for 25 people, Top 5 EA $44.52 $222.60 No Bid No Bid $21.87 $109.35 Serviigﬁjgeas # $32.45
’ Safety #K25 FMP # 280-1471 ’ ’ ’ 11308 ’
Food storage container with lid, 2
32. quart capacity, Cambro 62 EA $5.47 $339.14 $5.74 $355.88 $5.77 $357.74 $5.97 $370.14
#RFSCW2, w/lid #RFSCWC2
Food storage container with lid, 4 Non-
33. | quart capacity, Cambro 12 EA $8.05 $96.60 $8.39 $100.68 $8.50 $102.00 Non-responsive responsive
#RFSCW4, w/lid #RFSCWC2 P
Food storage container with lid, 6 Non-
34. | quart capacity, Cambro 24 EA $9.58 $229.92 $9.92 $238.08 $10.13 $243.12 Non-responsive responsive
#RFSCW6, w/lid #RFSCWC6 P
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Food storage container with lid, 8
35. | quart capacity, Cambro 30 EA $11.55 $346.50 $12.52 $375.60 $12.20 $366.00 $12.63 $378.90
#RFSCW8 w/lid #RFSCW C6
Food storage container with lid,
36. | 22 quart capacity, Cambro 20 EA $121.82 $2,436.40 $27.78 $555.60 $26.59 $531.80 $28.27 $565.40
#RFSCW22 w/lid #RFSCW 12
37. | Funnel, 1 quart, Vollrath #84770 4 EA $25.17 $100.68 $25.90 $103.60 $26.57 $106.28 $27.51 $110.04
Gloves, freezer, heavy terry work $11.56
38. | glove w/band cuff, 9% in. long, 100 PR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 $225.00 Best Value Textiles $115.60
Calico #G7P FGI-OR
Gloves, latex lined 11 in. long, e ig'gg $f22725480
39. | medium gauge, sizes S, M, L & PR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid : o No Bid No Bid
XL Calico #G3P 1200-L $0.59 $708.00
’ 300-XL $0.59 $177.00
Sloves, nitrle coated, lined, 11in. | 75 _s $1.08 $81.00
40. | Ong, 22 Ml thicK, punclure- 400-M | PR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.08 $432.00 No Bid No Bid
resistant, embossed grip, sizes S, 260 - L $1.08 $280.80
M, L, Calico #37175 ) )
Knife, butcher, 10-in. blade,
41. Mundial #W56525-10 8 EA $11.34 $90.72 $11.77 $94.16 $9.83 $78.64 $16.52 $132.16
Knife, French, cook's forged high
42. | carbon, 10-in. blade, Mundial 24 EA No Bid No Bid $12.77 $306.48 $10.88 $261.12 $18.29 $438.96
#SCW561010
Knife, fruit & utility, 6-in. straight . Non-
43. blade, SS, Mundial #W5614 50 EA Non-Responsive Responsive $5.88 $294.00 $5.08 $254.00 $8.26 $413.00
Knife, paring, 3'2-in. blade, Non-
44. | Mundial #W5601. Individually 450 EA Non-Responsive R . $2.77 $1,246.50 $2.32 $1,044.00 $92.04 $41,418.00
. . esponsive
packed with protective sleeves
Knife, slicing, 10-in. blade,
45. | scalloped edge, Mundial 45 EA $7.70 $346.50 $7.92 $356.40 $6.78 $305.10 $11.21 $504.45
#W562710E
Ladder, 3-step aluminum, ansi- . . . .
46. type 1, 4 foot, Grainger #4W074 10 EA $72.82 $728.20 No Bid No Bid $103.18 $1,031.80 No Bid No Bid
Ladle, 1 oz., SS one piece 11"
47. handle, 2 T cap., Vollrath #46811 50 EA $1.02 $51.00 $1.26 $63.00 $1.72 $86.00 $1.12 $56.00
Ladle, 2 oz., SS one piece 11"
48. handle, 4 T cap., Vollrath #46812 42 EA $1.26 $52.92 $1.49 $62.58 $2.08 $87.36 $1.38 $57.96
Ladle, 4 oz., SS one piece 11"
49. handle, 8 T cap., Vollrath #46814 5 EA $1.70 $8.50 $1.97 $9.85 $2.82 $14.10 $1.86 $9.30
Ladle, 6 oz., SS one piece 11”
50. handle, 12T cap., Vollrath #46816 2 EA $2.14 $4.28 $2.47 $4.94 $3.56 $7.12 $2.34 $4.68
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Ladle, 8 oz., SS one piece 11"

51. handle, 1 cup cap. Vollrath #46818 6 EA $2.87 $17.22 $3.24 $19.44 $4.75 $28.50 $3.14 $18.84
Measurer, graduated 1/4 to 1 cup,

52. aluminum, Wearever #5350 25 EA $6.26 $156.50 $5.70 $142.50 $5.72 $143.00 $6.84 $171.00
Measurer, 1 quart aluminum,

53. Wearever #5261 25 EA $13.39 $334.75 $12.06 $301.50 $12.33 $308.25 $14.63 $365.75
Measurer, 4 quart aluminum,

54, Wearever #5264 22 EA $20.84 $458.48 $18.81 $413.82 $19.04 $418.88 $22.77 $500.94
Measurers, nested graduated

55. | aluminum for 1/4 to 1 cup, Ekco 80 EA $5.87 $469.60 $3.39 $271.20 $4.38 $350.40 $4.93 $394.40
#HLK66
Oven Mitt, extra heavy-weight, $6.88 $2.48

56. | lined terry, 17 in. long, Jomac 75 EA Best Value # $516.00 | o f:}iog’{'?m $%22'f°’ $2.98 $223.50 Admiral Craft# | $186.00
#PH14 817TM ) pr. 11M-FG17
Paddle, mixing, kettle, 53", blades

57. | on both sides, 18%." x 6", all SS, 18 EA $148.82 $2,678.76 $131.43 $2,365.74 $135.87 $2,445.66 $162.60 $2,926.80
Wearever #5756
Pan, cobbler, full size 18” x 26” x

58. 2’ Wearever #5312 6 EA $39.47 $236.82 $35.56 $213.36 $36.04 $216.24 $43.13 $258.78
Pan, cobbler, half size 18" x 13” x

59. 2" Wearever #4455 12 EA $34.24 $410.88 $30.70 $368.40 $31.26 $375.12 $37.41 $448.92
Pan, insert Sulfon-X, 22" deep,

60. 12" x 10", Cambro #22HP 6 EA $10.04 $60.24 $10.37 $62.22 $10.32 $61.92 $11.61 $69.66
Pan, insert Sulfon-X, 4" deep, 12"

61. x 10", Cambro #24HP 2 EA $21.74 $43.48 $13.47 $26.94 $13.42 $26.84 $15.10 $30.20
Pan drain tray, false bottom, for

62. | insert pan, Sulfon-X, 12" x 10", 2 EA $7.02 $14.04 $6.24 $12.48 $6.14 $12.28 $6.90 $13.80
Cambro #20HPD
Pan, insert lid, 12" x 10" notched,

63. Sulfon-X. Cambro #20HPCHN 6 EA $9.56 $57.36 $9.84 $59.04 $10.01 $60.06 $11.07 $66.42
Pan, pizza, 18” round, heavy wgt.

64. American Metalcraft #HATP18 150 EA $9.80 $1,470.00 $5.26 $789.00 $8.86 $1,329.00 $5.56 $1,284.00
Pan, sauce, 1'% quart, Wearever

65. #4341-1/2, wicool handle 6 EA $14.42 $86.52 $12.36 $74.16 $13.39 $80.34 $15.75 $94.50
Pan, sauce lid, for 12-quart pan,

66. Wearever #4341C 2 EA $7.45 $14.90 $6.85 $13.70 $6.93 $13.86 $8.14 $16.28
Pan, sauce, 2% quart, Wearever

67. #4342-1/2, with cool handle 6 EA $18.79 $112.74 $16.88 $101.28 $17.45 $104.70 $20.53 $123.18
Pan, sauce lid, for 2%-quart pan,

68. Wearever #4342C 1 EA $7.88 $7.88 $7.18 $7.18 $7.33 $7.33 $8.61 $8.61
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Pan, sauce 8% -quart, Wearever

69. | #4348-1/2, with cool handle, 3004 3 EA $34.24 $102.72 $30.59 $91.77 $31.53 $94.59 $37.41 $112.23
aluminum alloy
Pan, sauce lid for 8'-quart pan,

70. Wearever #4348C 3 EA $13.50 $40.50 $12.14 $36.42 $12.33 $36.99 $14.75 $44.25
Pan, sauce 10 quart, Wearever

71. #4350, with cool handle 3 EA $37.69 $113.07 $33.69 $101.07 $34.42 $103.26 $41.18 $123.54
Pan, sauce lid for 10-quart pan,

72. Wearever #4350C 3 EA $15.66 $46.98 $14.11 $42.33 $14.30 $42.90 $17.11 $51.33
Pan, sheet, full size 18" x 26" x 1",

73. 12 gauge, Wearever #5315 500 EA $24.68 $12,340.00 $25.95 $12,975.00 $19.14 $9,570.00 $26.96 $13,480.00
Pan, sheet, half size 18" x 13" x

74. 17, 18 gauge, Wearever #5303 450 EA $9.34 $4,203.00 $6.26 $2,817.00 $5.82 $2,619.00 $10.21 $4,594.50
Pan, steam table, full size, 12" x

75. | 20" x 2'%" perforated SS, 22 45 EA $25.61 $1,152.45 $26.69 $1,201.05 $27.86 $1,253.70 $27.99 $1,259.55
gauge, Vollrath #30023
Pan, steam table, full size

76. | perforated 12" x 20” x 4”, 22 24 EA $32.08 $769.92 $32.86 $788.64 $34.88 $837.12 $35.05 $841.20
gauge SS, Vollrath #30043
Pan, steam table, full size solid

77. 12" x 20” x 22", 20 gauge SS, 126 EA $23.08 $2,908.08 $24.19 $3,047.94 $25.09 $3,161.34 $25.23 $3,178.98
Vollrath #30020
Pan, steam table, full size solid

78. 12” x 20” x 4”, 20 gauge SS, 60 EA $31.10 $1,866.00 $32.59 $1,955.40 $33.81 $2,028.60 $33.98 $2,038.80
Vollrath #30040
Pan, steam table, one-fourth size,

79. | 6-3/8” x 10-3/8” x 4”, 22 gauge 30 EA $11.96 $358.80 $12.27 $368.10 $12.62 $378.60 $13.06 $391.80
solid SS, Vollrath #30442
Pan, steam table, half size

80. | perforated 12" x 10" x 4”, 22 16 EA $21.00 $336.00 $21.97 $351.52 $22.83 $365.28 $22.94 $367.04
gauge SS, Vollrath #30243
Pan, steam table, half size solid

81. 12" x 10” x 4”7, 20 gauge SS, 80 EA $20.61 $1,648.80 $21.54 $1,723.20 $22.42 $1,793.60 $22.58 $1,800.80
Vollrath #30240
Pan, steam table, half size

82. | perforated 12" x 10” x 2%”, 22 30 EA $17.01 $510.30 $17.86 $535.80 $18.53 $555.90 $18.59 $557.70
gauge SS, Vollrath #30223
Pan, steam table, half size solid

83. 12" x 10" x 22", 22 gauge SS, 112 EA $9.96 $1,115.52 $10.30 $1,153.60 $10.52 $1,178.24 $10.89 $1,219.68
Vollrath #30222
Pan cover, steam table, solid flat

84. | full size, 20 gauge SS, Vollrath 12 EA $19.68 $236.16 $20.96 $251.52 $21.40 $256.80 $21.51 $258.12
#77250
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Pan cover, steam table, solid flat

85. | half size, 20 gauge SS, Vollrath 50 EA $9.53 $476.50 $10.06 $503.00 $10.36 $518.00 $10.41 $520.50
#75120

. $0.73

86. | Peeler, Nickel-plated 3-K, Halco 8 EA $2.67 $21.36 $1.67 $13.36 Calico 343LSS $5.84 $2.88 $23.04
Pitcher, clear plastic, 2-quart

87. wihandle, Rubbermaid #3338 34 EA $5.40 $183.60 $5.29 $179.86 $5.59 $190.06 $6.02 $204.68
Pot, coffee, 90-cup electric, Regal $118.00 $132.43

88. ) ’ ’ 7 EA $131.11 $917.77 ; $826.00 $121.26 $848.82 Admiral Craft # $927.01
#K7001 Regal 58001R CP-100
Pot, stock 9 quart, welded handle,

89. Wearever, #4302 3 EA $32.72 $98.16 $30.00 $90.00 $29.88 $89.64 $35.75 $107.25
Pot, stock 12 quart, welded

90. handle, Wearever #4303 3 EA $37.58 $112.74 $34.30 $102.90 $34.31 $102.93 $41.06 $123.18
Pot holder, pan handlers double $24.65 $25.32 $10.11

91. | thick terry, 10" x 11”, Calico 340 DOz Best Value $8,381.00 B Value.803PG $8,608.80 $14.24 $4,841.60 | Best Value Textiles | $3,437.40
#PH1C, no wrist slit Textiles # 823TPH ) # 802SPH
Pourer, sugar 12-ounce glass

92. WISS lid, Halco #57S 12 EA $19.25 $231.00 $1.00 $12.00 $1.21 $14.52 $16.37 $196.44

93. EZﬁ'i‘s'lg'EthaSher flatware, 20 EA $10.35 $207.00 $11.67 $233.40 $10.72 $214.40 $15.08 $301.60

o4, | Rack dishwasher plate and tray, 21 EA $10.35 $217.35 $11.67 $245.07 $10.97 $230.37 $54.73 $1,149.33
Rack, tray, 19% x 19%, open end $35.97

95. for 18" x 26" pans, Carlisle ROP 12 EA Carlisle # RSP-14 $431.64 $19.11 $229.32 $18.49 $221.88 $25.12 $301.44
Rack, dunnage, polyethylene, 4"

96. | legs, holds 1500 Ibs., slotted top, 2 EA $94.77 $189.54 $117.45 $234.90 $99.16 $198.32 $103.55 $207.10
12" x 21” x 30", Cambro #DRS300
Rack, dunnage, polyethylene, 4"

97. | legs, holds 3000 Ibs., slotted top, 2 EA $123.93 $247.86 $146.90 $293.80 $129.67 $259.34 $135.41 $270.82
12" x 21” x 48”, Cambro #DRS480
Rolling Pin, ball bearing, must be $6.90 $9.53

98. 15" long, Adcraft #ROP-15 45 EA $10.56 $475.20 Update RPW3215 $310.50 Windo WRP15 $428.85 $8.20 $369.00
Scales, Pelouze #Y32R, 2-Ib., . .

99. capacity, graduated by % ounce 10 EA $48.66 $486.60 $41.10 $411.00 $42.71 $427.10 No Bid No Bid
Scales, Pelouze #YG425R, 25-1b. . .

100. capacity, 2-ounce graduation 8 EA $50.21 $401.68 $41.10 $328.80 $44.24 $353.92 No Bid No Bid
Scale, baker’s 16 Ib. x % oz.,

101. Edlund #BDS16 3 EA $403.15 $1,209.45 $319.70 $959.10 $333.31 $999.93 $377.60 $1,132.80
Scoop, disher, #30, NSF

102. approved, Volirath #47146 28 EA $6.17 $172.76 $6.36 $179.08 $6.71 $187.88 $6.75 $189.00
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Bid Tabulation
RNM-9000
Cafeteria Smallwares
August 7, 2008
Nancy Markov, Buyer

703-791-8742; FAX: 703-791-7462

Acme Paper & Supply
James Brener, Account
Representative
8229 Sandy Ct.

P.O. Box 422
Savage, MD 20763
Phone: 800-462-5812 ext. 1267
Fax: 410-792-2137

Buller Fixture
Eileen T. Newton, Sales
Manager
6828 L St.
Omaha, NE 68117
Phone: 800-444-2601-112
Fax: 402-592-0763

Calico Industries, Inc.
Michael L. Heverly, Sr.,
Dir./Bids & Contracts
9045 Junction Drive
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701
Phone: 800-638-0828
Fax: 301-575-0131

Eastern Bag & Paper
Company, Inc.
John Kennedy, Territory Sales
Manager
P.O. Box 591
New Market, MD 21774
Phone: 301-712-7988
Fax: 800-643-5905

Unit Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price &
Item D . Est. of brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total
# P Qty. I other than Price other than Price other than Price other than Price
ssue i i i i
specified) specified) specified) specified)
Scoop, disher, #40, 13/5 T., NSF
103. approved, Vollrath #47147 22 EA $6.17 $135.74 $6.36 $139.92 $6.71 $147.62 $6.75 $148.50
Scoop, disher, #16, ¥4 cup, NSF
104. approved, Vollrath #47143 30 EA $6.17 $185.10 $6.36 $190.80 $6.71 $201.30 $6.75 $202.50
Scoop, disher, #12, 1/3 cup, NSF
105. approved, Vollrath #47142 30 EA $6.17 $185.10 $6.36 $190.80 $6.71 $201.30 $6.75 $202.50
Scoop, disher, #8, /2 cup, NSF
106. approved, Vollrath #47140 35 EA $6.17 $215.95 $6.36 $222.60 $6.71 $234.85 $6.75 $236.25
Scoop, disher, #6, 2/3 cup, NSF
107. approved, Volirath # 47139 50 EA $6.17 $308.50 $6.36 $318.00 $6.71 $335.50 $6.75 $337.50
Scoop, disher #8, V2 cup,
108. squeeze-type, Volrath #47150 24 EA $6.51 $156.24 $6.60 $158.40 $7.07 $169.68 $7.12 $170.88
Scoop, flour, 38 ounce, 12 3/8-in.
100. long, Volirath #46893 4 EA $7.97 $31.88 $8.11 $32.44 $8.41 $33.64 $8.71 $34.84
Scoop, ice, 24 ounce, Cambro
110. #SCP24CW 12 EA $4.13 $49.56 $4.26 $51.12 $3.92 $47.04 $4.52 $54.24
Scoop, sugar, 24 ounce, 11 3/8-
111. in. long, Vollrath #46892 4 EA $6.03 $24.12 $6.18 $24.72 $6.36 $25.44 $6.58 $26.32
Scraper, bowl, all plastic, no . . . . $1.16 $1.27
12 | handle, Leon Bush #1350 40 EA NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Calico 341350 $46.40 Halco Fs-8446 | $5080
Scrubber with handle, floor, 1 %4” $8.20
plastic fiber bristles, with two- Carlisle i . Non-
113. position trim, 10", Carlisle 40423 28 EA $7.16 $200.48 $7.98 $223.44 40423/Abco $229.60 Non-responsive responsive
with #40261 54-in. handle 01104
Shakers, salt and pepper, 3-o0z. . Non-
114. cap., glass w/SS top, Halco #156 45 EA Non-Responsive Responsive $0.76 $34.20 $0.59 $26.55 $59.96 $2,698.20
115, | Sharpener, knife, electric, Ediund 1 EA $351.95 $351.95 $297.70 $297.70 $312.65 $312.65 $351.05 $351.05
. . . $0.81 $0.84
116, | Silver cylinders, white nylon, 175 | EA $1.26 $220.50 Admiral Craft $141.75 Johnson Rose $147.00 $2.71 $474.25
Steri-Sil Vollrath 52643
Cyl-m 5255
Silver holder, 6 hole, SS, 15" x
117. | 11.5” x 8.5”, Vollrath Silv-a- 8 EA $47.24 $377.92 $49.54 $396.32 $80.92 $647.36 $51.61 $412.88
Trainer #97241
11g, | Silverware, forks, medium weight | 45 599 | poz $1.21 $18,150.00 $1.57 $23,550.00 $1.21 $18,150.00 | U date A Wi | $27.450.00
" | SS, Windsor #LWE95 ’ Winco 0002-05 U Walco 7205 e : U P 35 T
119, | Silverware, knives, medium 10 | poz $2.35 $23.50 $3.13 $31.30 $2.64 $2640 | U date oA W $38.50
" | weight, SS, Windsor #.WE98 Winco 0002-08 : Walco 722 : : : P 38 :
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8229 Sandy Ct.

P.O. Box 422
Savage, MD 20763
Phone: 800-462-5812 ext. 1267
Fax: 410-792-2137

Buller Fixture
Eileen T. Newton, Sales
Manager
6828 L St.
Omaha, NE 68117
Phone: 800-444-2601-112
Fax: 402-592-0763

Calico Industries, Inc.
Michael L. Heverly, Sr.,
Dir./Bids & Contracts
9045 Junction Drive
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701
Phone: 800-638-0828
Fax: 301-575-0131

Eastern Bag & Paper
Company, Inc.
John Kennedy, Territory Sales
Manager
P.O. Box 591
New Market, MD 21774
Phone: 301-712-7988
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Unit Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price & Unit Price &
Item D . Est. of brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total
# P Qty. I other than Price other than Price other than Price other than Price
ssue Lo Lo Lo Lo
specified) specified) specified) specified)
) . $1.83
Silverware, tablespoons, medium $1.21 $3.19 ,
120. weight, SS, Winco 0002-10 22 DOZ Winco 0002-03 $26.62 Walco 7203 $70.18 $3.03 $66.66 Update Ig;l #WM- $40.26
121, | Silverware, teaspoons, medium | 14 554 | poz $0.78 $8,970.00 $1.06 $12,190.00 $0.86 $9,890.00 | U date$ e wi | $13.800.00
" | weight, SS, Windsor #LWEO01 ’ Winco 0002-01 T Walco 7201 U Winco LWE91 A P 31 DA
Spatula, frosting, semi-flexible
122. | SS, 6%:" x 1'%”, Dexter Russell 12 EA $8.73 $104.76 $7.02 $84.24 $9.86 $118.32 $7.62 $91.44
#S2496
123, | Spatula, lasagna, 3' x 6" blade, 2 EA $6.28 $150.72 $6.48 $155.52 $5.53 $132.72 $9.15 $219.60
" | plastic handle, Mundial #5685 ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ ’
Spatula, pancake turner, 2" x 4",
124. SS blade, Dexter #5242 38 EA $10.74 $408.12 $8.58 $326.04 $10.36 $393.68 $9.35 $355.30
Spatula, rubber, 16%” long,
125. Rubbermaid #1906 90 EA $2.91 $261.90 $2.89 $260.10 $3.35 $301.50 $3.07 $276.30
126, | SPO0dle, 2 ounce, sold, Vollrath 3 EA $6.07 $18.21 $6.29 $18.87 $6.73 $20.19 $6.64 $19.92
Spoodle, 2 ounce, perforated,
127. Volirath #61155 16 EA $6.07 $97.12 $6.29 $100.64 $6.73 $107.68 $6.64 $106.24
128, | SPoodle: 4 ounce, sold, Vollrath 34 EA $6.07 $206.38 $6.29 $213.86 $6.73 $228.82 $6.64 $225.76
Spoodle, 4 ounce, perforated,
129. Vollirath #61170 58 EA $6.07 $352.06 $6.29 $364.82 $6.73 $390.34 $6.64 $385.12
130. gg;’;’g'ze' 8 ounce, solid, Vollrath 35 EA $6.46 $226.10 $6.69 $234.15 $7.18 $251.30 $7.07 $247.45
Spoon, cook's slotted or
131. | perforated bowl, 13" handle, SS, 12 EA $1.26 $15.12 $1.46 $17.52 $1.63 $19.56 $1.38 $16.56
Vollrath #46975
Spoon, cook's solid bowl 13"
132. handle. SS, Vollrath #46973 20 EA $1.26 $25.20 $1.46 $29.20 $1.63 $32.60 $1.38 $27.60
Spoon, measuring, graduated set $0.68 $1.31
1 1 i . -
133. | of 4, 1T, 1t,, Y2 t.,, Y4 t., Winco 142 EA $0.33 $46.86 Halco 2316 $96.56 $1.11 $157.62 Halco # 2314 $186.02
MSP4P
134, | Shoon, serving, solid, Vollrath 6 EA $3.50 $21.00 $3.79 $22.74 $4.38 $26.28 $3.82 $22.92
Thermometer, Food Testing, 0 —
200 degrees F, Cooper #1246-02,
135. 1-inch dial with sheath and built-in 450 EA $8.05 $3,622.50 $4.55 $2,047.50 $4.97 $2,236.50 $8.79 $3,955.50
calibration wrench.
Thermometer, oven, Cooper $3.29 $3.78 $49.14
136. #724HP ’ 13 EA Cooper-Atkins # $42.77 $3.69 $47.97 Alternate : Taylor Alternate : $3.60 $46.80
24HP-01-1 273506 $2.84 $36.92
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RNM-9000
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August 7, 2008

Nancy Markov, Buyer
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8229 Sandy Ct.

P.O. Box 422
Savage, MD 20763
Phone: 800-462-5812 ext. 1267
Fax: 410-792-2137

Buller Fixture
Eileen T. Newton, Sales
Manager
6828 L St.
Omaha, NE 68117
Phone: 800-444-2601-112
Fax: 402-592-0763

Calico Industries, Inc.
Michael L. Heverly, Sr.,
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Fax: 301-575-0131
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Item D . Est. of brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total brand/item (if Total
# P Qty. I other than Price other than Price other than Price other than Price
ssue iee iee iee iee
specified) specified) specified) specified)
Thermometer, refrigerator/freezer,
137. | Comark UTL140 w/magnetic 46 EA No Bid No Bid $2.37 $109.02 $2.22 $102.12 $2.35 $108.10
mount
Timer, minute, digital, Comark . .
138. UTL882 150 EA No Bid No Bid $10.75 $1,612.50 $11.33 $1,699.50 $11.51 $1,726.50
Tongs, plastic, 9” long, Cambro
139. #9TGS, clear (#135) 60 EA $1.51 $90.60 $1.67 $100.20 $1.60 $96.00 $1.94 $116.40
Tongs, spring-operated handle, $1.36 $0.81 $0.67
140. | SS, 9%" long, Johnson Rose 190 EA Johnson Rose # $258.40 U dafe ST9 $153.90 $0.92 $174.80 Update Int'l # ST- $127.30
#723064 3569 P 9LR
Towel, terry, white, approximately $18.84/case $7.85 $8.67
141. | 15" x 26", packed in 5-Ib. cartons, 675 DOz Cus.tom 45R $1,884.00 North .Shore $5,298.75 $6.94 $4,684.50 | Best Value Textiles | $5,852.25
finished edges, Calico 13DT4W # 703HB
Trash can with lid and dolly,
Rubbermaid Brute #2643 44-
142. gallon can wilid #2645 and dolly 8 EA $84.45 $675.60 $96.00 $768.00 $74.47 $595.76 $98.52 $788.16
#2640
Trash can, restroom, covered, 18-
143. | quart, step-on, Rubbermaid 13 EA $62.44 $811.72 $66.00 $585.00 $49.97 $649.61 $65.79 $855.27
#6142
Trays, 6 compartment, 10" x 14",
144. | Carlisle #43988, 12/case, any 7,500 CS $7.67 $57,525.00 $48.48 $363,600.00 $46.24 $346,800.00 $8.53 $63,975.00
color available
Tray, flat, fiberglass 12" x 167,
145. Amazon Blue, Cambro #1216 700 EA $7.78 $5,446.00 $8.07 $5,679.00 $7.59 $5,313.00 $8.50 $5,950.00
146. | Tray, cater, Vollrath #47251 12 EA $12.59 $151.08 $13.39 $160.68 $13.70 $164.40 Non-responsive res';gg;,ive
147. | Tray, round, Vollrath #47216 18 EA $20.36 $366.48 $20.67 $372.06 $22.16 $398.88 $22.25 $400.50
$1.38
Tray, ice cube, plastic, . . . . Rubbermaid $16.56 for . .
148. Rubbermaid #2865 24 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 318365PWSET 12 sets No Bid No Bid
Set of 2
Turner, hamburger, 4” x 5%”
149. | blade, American Metalcraft 12 EA $6.14 $73.68 $5.81 $69.72 $7.17 $86.04 $5.73 $68.76
#PS19075 (for pizza service)
150. ;’gg tea, SS, 3 gallon, Cecilware 5 EA $605.30 $605.30 $81.20 $406.00 $84.00 $420.00 $82.60 $413.00
Whip, wire, French SS wires,
151. | brassplated, 14" long, Vollrath 15 EA $6.32 $94.80 $6.58 $98.70 $6.96 $104.40 $6.90 $103.50
#47092
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Bid Tabulation
RNM-9000
Cafeteria Smallwares
August 7, 2008
Nancy Markov, Buyer
703-791-8742; FAX: 703-791-7462

Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Mark Tell, President
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735
Phone: 631-501-9700
Fax: 631-501-9709

Smith Housewares & Restaurant Supply
Discount Outlet Inc.
M. John Kuppermann, President
500 Erie Blvd. East
Syracuse, NY 13202
Phone: 315-474-8731
Fax: 315-478-7004

United Restaurant Equipment
Alicia Knoll, Sales
P.O. Box 61980
Harrisburg, PA 17106
Phone: 717-238-1214
Fax: 717-238-3756

ltem o Est. Unit Unit Pric.e & Total Unit Pric.e & Total Unit Pric.e & )
# Description aty of brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Total Price
i Issue than specified) than specified) than specified)
Bin, ingredient Cambro #IB36, 34
1. gallons with sliding lid 20 EA $190.35 $3,807.00 $148.47 $2,969.40 $160.00 $3,200.00
Board, cutting 12" x 18" Katchall,
2. Poly-Slice #CB-12181% 36 EA $15.29 $550.44 $9.44 $339.84 $6.95 $250.20
Bowl, mixing 1% quart, SS,
3. Vollrath #69014 8 EA $7.67 $61.36 $6.53 $52.24 $8.15 $65.20
4. | B, mixing 4 quart, SS Vollrath 1 EA $11.58 $11.58 $9.86 $9.86 $37.55 $37.55
5. | Soun, mixing 8 quart, S Vollrath 13 EA $18.56 $241.28 $15.80 $205.40 $19.35 $251.55
Bowl, mixing w/stand 30 quart, SS
6. Vollrath #7930-1 1 EA $644.55 $644.55 $548.44 $548.44 $575.00 $575.00
Bowl, salad 8", Vollrath #52869,
7. sold 48/case 696 EA $2.64 $1,837.44 $2.25 $1,566.00 $2.40 $1,670.40
Bowl, salad, 18", 19.2 quart
8. | capacity, clear plastic pebbled 1 EA $19.62 $19.62 $15.91 $15.91 No Bid No Bid
design, Cambro #PSB18
Bowl, soup rim nappie 14-15
9. ounce, assorted colors, Cambro 960 EA $1.59 $1,526.40 $1.31 $1,257.60 $1.30 $1,248.00
#50CW
Box, food storage clear plastic
10. | w/lid, 18" x 12" x 6" deep, Cambro 36 EA $17.79 $640.44 $18.03 $649.08 $16.70 $601.20
#12186CW, w/#1218CCW lid
Box, food storage clear plastic
11. | w/lid 18" x 26" x 6" deep, Cambro 12 EA $34.03 $408.36 $34.50 $414.00 $31.90 $382.80
#18226CW, w/#1826CCW lid
Brush, dishwasher machine, 24",
12. | nylon bristles anchored in steel 5 EA $12.71 $63.55 $8.44 $42.20 $8.85 $44.25
wire, Carlisle #40159
Brush, kettle, with 20" handle,
13. | Carlisle brush #40040 w/handle 8 EA $27.16 $217.28 $18.02 $144.16 $18.95 $151.60
#40230
14, | Drush, ketlle drain valve, Carlisle 6 EA $4.61 $27.66 $3.06 $18.36 $3.20 $19.20
Brush, pan lip, plastic block
15. | handle, stiff 1" bristles, Carlisle 6 EA $4.42 $26.52 $2.93 $17.58 $3.10 $18.60
#40024
16, | Brush, pastry, plastic handle, 40 EA $8.82 $352.80 $5.63 $225.20 $5.90 $236.00
" | nylon bristles, Carlisle #40393 ' ' ' ' ' '
Brush, vegetable, plastic handle,
17. | nylon bristles set in heavy gauge 14 EA $6.67 $93.38 $4.43 $62.02 $4.65 $65.10
steel wire, Carlisle #40164
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Bid Tabulation
RNM-9000
Cafeteria Smallwares
August 7, 2008
Nancy Markov, Buyer

703-791-8742; FAX: 703-791-7462
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Farmingdale, NY 11735
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Smith Housewares & Restaurant Supply
Discount Outlet Inc.
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ltem Est Unit Unit Price & Total Unit Price & Total Unit Price &
# Description at . of brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Total Price
Y Issue than specified) than specified) than specified)
18. | Caddy, Rack, Caddy Model #T-20 10 EA $389.69 $3,896.90 $352.17 $3,521.70 $375.00 $3,750.00
19. | Caddy, Tray, Caddy Model #T-40 10 EA $389.69 $3,896.90 $349.53 $3,495.30 $375.00 $3,750.00
20. g;ngOpener, electric, Edlund 1 EA $508.13 $508.13 $433.10 $433.10 $465.00 $465.00
21. | Can Opener, manual, Edlund #1 6 EA $87.97 $527.82 $77.57 $465.42 $85.00 $510.00
Chafer, oblong, Vollrath #46880,
20, | toinclude 2%-inch food pan, 6 EA $203.04 $1,218.24 $175.77 $1,036.62 $180.00 $1,080.00
dripless water pan, dome cover
and 2 fuel holders
Colander, 16 quart, Wearever $62.77
23. #4616 1 EA $82.31 $82.31 Vollrath 68350 $62.77 $69.00 $69.00
Crock, plain with lid, 1.2 quart, . .
24. white, Cambro #ECP12 50 EA $3.91 $195.50 $3.17 $158.50 No Bid No Bid
Crock, plain with lid, white, 2.7
25. quart, Cambro #CP27 30 EA $5.55 $166.50 $4.50 $135.00 $4.25 $127.50
$2.26
26. | Cutter, dough, Mundial #5697 60 EA $7.93 $475.80 American Metal $135.60 No Bid No Bid
DSP6705
Cutter, dough 5 wheel marker, $15.87 $15.38
27- | Admiral Craft #ADD-5WH 30 EA | AIDMTL MCDS set $476.10 Alecacy 2225 $461.40 $15.75 $472.50
Cutter, pizza, 4" diameter,
28. | stainless steel blade, American 60 EA $4.70 $282.00 $3.69 $221.40 $3.60 $216.00
Metalcraft #PPC-4
Dipper, 30 ounce aluminum,
29. Wearever #5330 3 EA $43.83 $131.49 $37.67 $113.01 $35.00 $105.00
30, | Cutectio cover, 127 207, Vollrath 6 EA $142.50 $855.00 $121.26 $727.56 $130.00 $780.00
First Aid Kit for 25 people, Top $41.05 $34.54 . .
31. | safety #K25 5 EA FP 280-1471 $205.25 Service Ideas 1124S| $172.70 No Bid No Bid
Food storage container with lid, 2
32. | quart capacity, Cambro 62 EA $5.29 $327.98 $5.36 $332.32 $5.30 $328.60
#RFSCW?2, w/lid #RFSCWC2
Food storage container with lid, 4
33. | quart capacity, Cambro 12 EA $7.78 $93.36 $7.88 $94.56 $7.80 $93.60
#RFSCW4, w/lid #RFSCWC2
Food storage container with lid, 6
34. | quart capacity, Cambro 24 EA $9.27 $222.48 $9.38 $225.12 $9.35 $224.40
#RFSCW6, w/lid #RFSCW C6
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Food storage container with lid, 8
quart capacity, Cambro
35. #RFSCW8 wilid #RESCWCE 30 EA $11.17 $335.10 $11.32 $339.60 $11.25 $337.50
Food storage container with lid,
36. | 22 quart capacity, Cambro 20 EA $25.02 $500.40 $25.36 $507.20 $25.15 $503.00
#RFSCW22 w/lid #RFSCW12
37. | Funnel, 1 quart, Vollrath #84770 4 EA $27.39 $109.56 $23.31 $93.24 $29.15 $116.60
Gloves, freezer, heavy terry work $4.68 $9.82
e . . . .
38. gloye w/band cuff, 9% in. long, 100 PR Best Value # 667 $468.00 Best Value FGI-OR $982.00 No Bid No Bid
Calico #G7P
Gloves, latex lined 11 in. long, ivad 61,65 s1.47
39. medlum gauge, sizes S, M, L & 1200-L PR Best Value # 620 $7,194.00 Best Value # 620 $6,409.20 No Bid No Bid
XL, Calico #G3P
300-XL
Gloves, nitrile coated, lined, 11 in.
L ’ 4 75-S $3.42
40. | ong, 22 mil. thick, puncture- 400-M | PR 34.08 $2,998.80 Best Value # 13NU $2,513.70 No Bid No Bid
resistant, embossed grip, sizes S, 260 - L Best Value # 1300 Sz M &L onl
M, L, Calico #37175 ' y
Knife, butcher, 10-in. blade, $18.11 . .
41. Mundial #W56525-10 8 EA $14.80 $118.40 Dexter S112-10PCP $144.88 No Bid No Bid
Knife, French, cook's forged high $21.78
42. | carbon, 10-in. blade, Mundial 24 EA $16.39 $393.36 Mundial B|5511O-1O $522.72 No Bid No Bid
#SCW561010
Knife, fruit & utility, 6-in. straight $19.04 . .
43. blade, SS, Mundial #W5614 50 EA Mundial PPWS 111-6 $952.00 $5.40 $270.00 No Bid No Bid
Knife, paring, 3'2-in. blade, $1.43
44. | Mundial #W5601. Individually 450 EA $1.15 $517.50 ' $643.50 No Bid No Bid
. h Dexter P40843
packed with protective sleeves
Knife, slicing, 10-in. blade, $6.75
45. | scalloped edge, Mundial 45 EA $10.05 $452.25 Traex 594014 $303.75 No Bid No Bid
#W562710E
Ladder, 3-step aluminum, ansi- . . . . . .
46. type 1, 4 foot, Grainger #4W074 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ladle, 1 oz., SS one piece 11"
47. handle, 2 T cap., Vollrath #46811 50 EA $1.11 $55.50 $0.95 $47.50 $1.20 $60.00
Ladle, 2 oz., SS one piece 11"
48. handle, 4 T cap., Vollrath #46812 42 EA $1.37 $57.54 $1.17 $49.14 $1.50 $63.00
Ladle, 4 oz., SS one piece 11"
49. handle, 8 T cap., Vollrath #46814 5 EA $1.85 $9.25 $1.58 $7.90 $2.00 $10.00
Ladle, 6 oz., SS one piece 11”
50. handle, 12T cap., Vollrath #46816 2 EA $2.33 $4.66 $1.98 $3.96 $2.50 $5.00
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Bid Tabulation
RNM-9000
Cafeteria Smallwares
August 7, 2008
Nancy Markov, Buyer

703-791-8742; FAX: 703-791-7462

Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Mark Tell, President
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735
Phone: 631-501-9700
Fax: 631-501-9709

Smith Housewares & Restaurant Supply
Discount Outlet Inc.
M. John Kuppermann, President
500 Erie Blvd. East
Syracuse, NY 13202
Phone: 315-474-8731
Fax: 315-478-7004

United Restaurant Equipment
Alicia Knoll, Sales
P.O. Box 61980
Harrisburg, PA 17106
Phone: 717-238-1214
Fax: 717-238-3756

ltem Est Unit Unit Price & Total Unit Price & Total Unit Price &
# Description at . of brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Price brand/item (if other Total Price
Y Issue than specified) than specified) than specified)

Ladle, 8 oz., SS one piece 11"

51. handle, 1 cup cap. Vollrath #46818 6 EA $3.12 $18.72 $2.66 $15.96 $3.35 $20.10
Measurer, graduated 1/4 to 1 cup, $2.70

52| aluminum, Wearever #5350 % EA $6.82 $170.50 Browne HLK-661 $67.50 $5.70 $142.50
Measurer, 1 quart aluminum $4.18

53. ’ ’ 25 EA $14.57 $364.25 American Metalcraft $104.50 $12.00 $300.00
Wearever #5261 AM10
Measurer, 4 quart aluminum $7.78

54, ’ ’ 22 EA $22.68 $498.96 American Metalcraft $171.16 $18.95 $416.90
Wearever #5264 AM40
Measurers, nested graduated $6.35 $3.14

55. zlliljméglém for 1/4 to 1 cup, Ekco 80 EA Worldkit 1065228 $508.00 Alegacy ALK66 $251.20 $6.00 $480.00
Oven Mitt, extra heavy-weight, $9.95 $3.06

56. Lgeﬁ&arry, 17 in. long, Jomac 75 EA Best Value 817TM $746.25 Arden TTOM 7BE-BX $229.50 No Bid No Bid
Paddle, mixing, kettle, 53", blades $18.44

57. | on both sides, 18%." x 6", all SS, 18 EA $161.92 $2,914.56 American Metalcraft $331.92 $125.00 $2,250.00
Wearever #5756 2154
Pan, cobbler, full size 18” x 26” x $27.44

58. 2’ Wearever #5312 6 EA $42.95 $257.70 Vollrath 68357 $164.64 $35.75 $214.50
Pan, cobbler, half size 18" x 13" x $30.64

59. 2’ Wearever #4455 12 EA $37.25 $447.00 Vollrath 61270 $367.68 $30.95 $371.40
Pan, insert Sulfon-X, 22" deep,

60. 12" x 10", Cambro #22HP 6 EA $12.85 $77.00 $10.94 $65.64 $10.70 $64.20
Pan, insert Sulfon-X, 4" deep, 12"

61. x 10", Cambro #24HP 2 EA $16.71 $33.42 $14.22 $28.44 $13.90 $27.80
Pan drain tray, false bottom, for

62. | insert pan, Sulfon-X, 12" x 10", 2 EA $7.64 $15.28 $6.50 $13.00 $6.95 $13.90
Cambro #20HPD
Pan, insert lid, 12" x 10" notched,

63. Sulfon-X, Cambro #20HPCHN 6 EA $12.24 $73.44 $10.42 $62.52 $10.20 $61.20
Pan, pizza, 18” round, heavy wgt.

64. American Metalcraft #HATP18 150 EA $9.46 $1,419.00 $8.14 $1,225.50 $7.95 $1,192.50
Pan, sauce, 1% quart, Wearever $11.75

65. #4341-1/2, wicool handle 6 EA $14.43 $86.58 Vollrath 68301 $70.50 $13.05 $78.30
Pan, sauce lid, for 1%%-quart pan, $6.03

66. Wearever #4341C 2 EA $7.46 $14.92 Vollrath 6744 $12.06 $6.75 $13.50
Pan, sauce, 2% quart, Wearever $13.28

67. #4342-1/2, with cool handle 6 EA $18.81 $112.86 Vollrath 68302 $79.68 $17.00 $102.00
Pan, sauce lid, for 2%-quart pan, $6.03

68. Wearever #4342C 1 EA $7.89 $7.89 Vollrath 67427 $6.03 $7.15 $7.15
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Pan, sauce 8.‘/2 -quart, Wearever $26.54

69. #434§-1/2, with cool handle, 3004 3 EA $34.27 $102.81 Vollrath 68308 $79.62 $30.95 $92.85
aluminum alloy
Pan, sauce lid for 8%:-quart pan, $8.55

70. Wearever #4348C 3 EA $13.51 $40.53 Vollrath 67417 $25.65 $12.25 $36.75
Pan, sauce 10 quart, Wearever $29.15

71. #4350 with cool handle 3 EA $37.73 $113.15 Vollrath 68310 $87.45 $35.00 $105.00
Pan, sauce lid for 10-quart pan, $10.89

72. Wearever #4350C 3 EA $15.67 $47.01 Vollrath 67418 $32.67 $14.95 $44.85
Pan, sheet, full size 18" x 26" x 1", $18.41

73. 12 gauge, Wearever #5315 500 EA $24.70 $12,350.00 Vollrath 68374 $9,205.00 $22.50 $11,250.00
Pan, sheet, half size 18" x 13" x $4.72

74. 17, 18 gauge, Wearever #5303 450 EA $10.59 $4,765.50 Advance 188A132X $2,124.00 $8.50 $3,825.00
Pan, steam table, full size, 12" x

75. | 20" x 2'%" perforated SS, 22 45 EA $27.87 $1,254.15 $23.72 $1,067.40 $24.90 $1,120.50
gauge, Vollrath #30023
Pan, steam table, full size

76. | perforated 12" x 20” x 4”, 22 24 EA $34.90 $837.60 $29.69 $712.56 $32.65 $783.60
gauge SS, Vollrath #30043
Pan, steam table, full size solid

77. | 12" x 20" x 2%%", 20 gauge SS, 126 EA $25.12 $3,165.12 $21.38 $2,693.88 $22.00 $2,772.00
Vollrath #30020
Pan, steam table, full size solid

78. | 12" x 20" x4”, 20 gauge SS, 60 EA $33.84 $2,030.40 $28.79 $1,727.40 $29.65 $1,779.00
Vollrath #30040
Pan, steam table, one-fourth size,

79. | 6-3/8" x 10-3/8” x 4”, 22 gauge 30 EA $13.01 $390.30 $11.07 $332.10 $11.40 $342.00
solid SS, Vollrath #30442
Pan, steam table, half size

80. | perforated 12" x 10" x 4”, 22 16 EA $22.84 $365.44 $19.44 $311.04 $24.30 $388.80
gauge SS, Vollrath #30243
Pan, steam table, half size solid

81. | 12" x10” x4”, 20 gauge SS, 80 EA $22.42 $1,793.60 $19.08 $1,526.40 $19.65 $1,572.00
Vollrath #30240
Pan, steam table, half size

82. | perforated 12" x 10” x 2'%”, 22 30 EA $18.51 $555.30 $15.75 $472.50 $16.25 $487.50
gauge SS, Vollrath #30223
Pan, steam table, half size solid

83. | 12" x 10" x 2'%”, 22 gauge SS, 112 EA $10.84 $1,214.08 $9.23 $1,033.76 $9.50 $1,064.00
Vollrath #30222
Pan cover, steam table, solid flat

84. | full size, 20 gauge SS, Vollrath 12 EA $21.41 $256.92 $18.23 $218.76 $20.05 $240.60
#77250
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Pan cover, steam table, solid flat

85. | half size, 20 gauge SS, Vollrath 50 EA $10.36 $518.00 $8.82 $441.00 $9.70 $485.00
#75120

86. | Peeler, Nickel-plated 3-K, Halco 8 EA $2.58 $20.64 $1.19 $9.52 $3.90 $31.20
Pitcher, clear plastic, 2-quart $3.11 . .

87| Wihandle, Rubbermaid #3338 34 EA $5.99 $203.66 Carlisle 5540 $105.74 No Bid No Bid
Pot, coffee, 90-cup electric, Regal $110.42

88. #K7001 7 EA $124.98 $874.86 Npw Focus # 58001R $772.94 $115.00 $805.00
Pot, stock 9 quart, welded handle, $21.78

89. Wearever, #4302 3 EA $35.60 $106.80 Vollrath 67508 $65.34 $29.65 $88.95
Pot, stock 12 quart, welded $26.18

90. handle, Wearever #4303 3 EA $40.89 $122.67 Vollrath 67512 $78.54 $34.00 $102.00
Pot holder, pan handlers double $27.81 $23.71

91. thick terry, 10 X 11. , Calico 340 DOz Best Value 823TP4 $9,455.40 Arden PG1 $8,061.40 No Bid No Bid
#PH1C, no wrist slit
Pourer, sugar 12-ounce glass

92. WISS lid, Halco #57S 12 EA $1.22 $14.64 $1.19 $14.28 $1.95 $23.40
Rack, dishwasher flatware,

93. Carlisle RF 20 EA $13.35 $267.00 $9.94 $198.80 $10.99 $219.80

g4, | Rack, dishwasher plate and tray, 21 EA $12.25 $257.25 $9.94 $208.74 $10.99 $230.79
Carlisle RP
Rack, tray, 19% x 19%, open end

95. for 18" x 26" pans, Carlisle ROP 12 EA $22.24 $266.88 $16.56 $198.72 $18.25 $219.00
Rack, dunnage, polyethylene, 4"

96. | legs, holds 1500 Ibs., slotted top, 2 EA $103.11 $206.22 $87.73 $175.46 $91.70 $183.40
12" x 21” x 30", Cambro #DRS300
Rack, dunnage, polyethylene, 4"

97. | legs, holds 3000 Ibs., slotted top, 2 EA $134.83 $269.66 $114.73 $229.46 $120.00 $240.00
12" x 21” x 48”, Cambro #DRS480
Rolling Pin, ball bearing, must be

98. 15" long, Adcraft #ROP-15 45 EA $7.19 $323.55 $7.19 $323.55 $7.65 $344.25
Scales, Pelouze #Y32R, 2-Ib., . .

99. capacity, graduated by % ounce 10 EA $46.00 $460.00 $45.69 $456.90 No Bid No Bid
Scales, Pelouze #YG425R, 25-1b. . .

100. capacity, 2-ounce graduation 8 EA $47.59 $380.72 $47.29 $378.32 No Bid No Bid
Scale, baker’s 16 Ib. x % oz.,

101. Edlund #BDS16 3 EA $349.68 $1,049.04 $320.22 $960.66 $335.00 $1,005.00
Scoop, disher, #30, NSF $4.55

102. | approved, Vollrath #47146 28 EA Adcraft 10S-30 $127.40 $5.72 $160.16 $7.15 $200.20
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Scoop, disher, #40, 13/5T., NSF
approved, Vollrath #47147 $4.55

103. 22 EA Adcraft 10S-40 $100.10 $5.72 $125.84 $7.15 $157.30
Scoop, disher, #16, ¥4 cup, NSF $4.55

104. approved, Volirath #47143 30 EA Adcraft ICS-16 $136.50 $5.72 $171.60 $7.15 $214.50
Scoop, disher, #12, 1/3 cup, NSF $4.55

105. approved, Volirath #47142 30 EA Adcraft ICS-12 $136.50 $5.72 $171.60 $7.15 $214.50
Scoop, disher, #8, /2 cup, NSF $4.55

106. approved, Volirath #47140 35 EA Adcraft ICS-8 $159.25 $5.72 $200.20 $7.15 $250.25
Scoop, disher, #6, 2/3 cup, NSF $4.55

107. approved, Volirath # 47139 50 EA Adcraft ICS-6 $227.50 $5.72 $286.00 $7.15 $257.50
Scoop, disher #8, V2 cup,

108. squeeze-type, Volrath #47150 24 EA $7.09 $170.16 $6.03 $144.72 $7.55 $181.20
Scoop, flour, 38 ounce, 12 3/8-in.

109. long, Volirath #46893 4 EA $8.67 $34.68 $7.38 $29.52 $9.25 $37.00
Scoop, ice, 24 ounce, Cambro

110. #SCP24CW 12 EA $4.49 $53.88 $3.83 $45.96 $4.95 $59.40
Scoop, sugar, 24 ounce, 11 3/8-

111. in. long, Vollrath #46892 4 EA $6.56 $26.24 $5.58 $22.32 $6.99 $27.96

112, | Scraper, bowi, all plastic, no 40 EA $1.14 $45.60 American Motalcraf $12.00 No Bid No Bid

" | handle, Leon Bush #1350 Halco FS8446 ' BS64 '

Scrubber with handle, floor, 1 %4”
plastic fiber bristles, with two-

113. position trim, 10", Carlisle 40423 28 EA $11.38 $318.64 $6.63 $185.64 $7.30 $204.40
with #40261 54-in. handle
Shakers, salt and pepper, 3-o0z. . .

114. cap., glass w/SS top, Halco #156 45 EA $0.75 $33.75 $0.63 $28.35 No Bid No Bid

115, | Srerpener, knife, electric, Edlund 1 EA $325.09 $325.09 $287.12 $287.12 $310.00 $310.00
Silver cylinders, white nylon, $2.11 $2.30 . .

116. Steri-Sil 175 EA Cambro FWC56 $369.25 Vollrath 52642 $402.50 No Bid No Bid
Silver holder, 6 hole, SS, 15" x

117. | 11.5” x 8.5”, Vollrath Silv-a- 8 EA $51.39 $411.12 $43.73 $349.84 $48.25 $386.00
Trainer #97241
Silverware, forks, medium weight $1.96 $1.26

118. SS, Windsor #LWE95 15,000 DOz Walco # 7205 $29,400.00 Walco 7205 $18,900.00 $2.05 $30,750.00
Silverware, knives, medium $4.29 $2.65

119. | weight, SS, Windsor #LWE98 10 DOz Walco # 7224 $42.90 Walco 7224 $26.50 $4.50 $45.00
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Silverware, tablespoons, medium
weight, SS, Winco 0002-10 $1.96 $1.26

120. 22 DOz Walco # 7207 $43.12 Walco 7207 $27.72 $3.75 $82.50
Silverware, teaspoons, medium $1.18 $0.76

121. weight, SS, Windsor #LWEO1 11,500 DOz Walco # 7201 $13,570.00 Walco 7201 $8,740.00 $1.25 $14,375.00
Spatula, frosting, semi-flexible

122. | SS, 6% x 1%", Dexter Russell 12 EA $7.59 $91.08 $7.24 $86.88 $7.45 $89.40
#52496
Spatula, lasagna, 3” x 6” blade $2.77

123. P o ’ 24 EA $8.20 $196.80 American Metalcraft $66.48 No Bid No Bid
plastic handle, Mundial #5685

PS12ST

Spatula, pancake turner, 2" x 4",

124. SS blade, Dexter #5242 38 EA $9.31 $353.78 $8.88 $337.44 $8.75 $332.50
Spatula, rubber, 16%” long, $3.23 $1.67 . .

125. | Rubbermaid #1906 90 EA Adcraft R-1906 $290.70 Volirath 52016 $150.30 No Bid No Bid

126. gg;’;’g'f' 2 ounc, solid, Vollrath 3 EA $6.61 $19.83 $5.63 $16.89 $7.25 $21.75
Spoodle, 2 ounce, perforated,

127. Vollrath #61155 16 EA $6.61 $105.76 $5.63 $90.08 $7.25 $116.00

128, gg;’;’?'ze' 4 ounce, solid, Vollrath 34 EA $6.61 $224.74 $5.63 $191.42 $7.25 $246.50
Spoodle, 4 ounce, perforated,

129. Vollrath #61170 58 EA $6.61 $383.38 $5.63 $326.54 $7.25 $420.50

130. gg;’;’g'ze' 8 ounce, solid, Vollrath 35 EA $7.03 $246.05 $5.99 $209.65 $7.50 $262.50
Spoon, cook's slotted or $0.82

131. | perforated bowl, 13" handle, SS, 12 EA Adcraft.DSL-13 $9.84 $1.17 $14.04 $1.50 $18.00
Vollrath #46975
Spoon, cook's solid bowl 13" $0.86

132. handle, SS. Vollrath #46973 20 EA Adcraft DSO-13 $17.20 $1.17 $23.40 $1.50 $30.00
Spoon, measuring, graduated set $0.54

133. | of 4, 1T., 1t., %2 t., Ya t., Winco 142 EA $0.36 $51.12 ’ $76.68 $1.25 $177.50

Browne 2316

MSP4P
Spoon, serving, solid, Vollrath

134. #4695 6 EA $3.81 $22.86 $3.24 $19.44 $4.25 $25.50
Thermometer, Food Testing, 0 —
200 degrees F, Cooper #1246-02,

135. 1-inch dial with sheath and built-in 450 EA $4.58 $2,061.00 $3.91 $1,759.50 $4.10 $845.00
calibration wrench.
Thermometer, oven, Cooper $2.37

136. H0724HP 13 EA $3.58 $46.54 Taylor 3506 $30.81 $3.45 $44.85
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Thermometer, refrigerator/freezer, $2.27

137. ggrstrk UTL140 w/magnetic 46 EA $2.34 $107.64 Taylor 5982N $104.42 No Bid No Bid
Timer, minute, digital, Comark $5.61 . .

138. UTL882 150 EA $11.46 $1,719.00 Taylor 5822 $841.50 No Bid No Bid
Tongs, plastic, 9” long, Cambro

139. H#9TGS, clear (#135) 60 EA $1.93 $115.80 $1.64 $98.40 $1.65 $99.00
Tongs, spring-operated handle, $0.74

140. | SS, 9%" long, Johnson Rose 190 EA $0.62 $117.80 : $140.60 No Bid No Bid

Adcraft LUT-10

#723064
Towel, terry, white, approximately $15.75 $14.01

141. 1.5. x 26", packed in 5-Ib. cartons, 675 DOz Best Value HT1275W $10,631.25 Best HTI275W $9,456.75 No Bid No Bid
finished edges, Calico 13DT4W
Trash can with lid and dolly, $56.89 $83.45
Rubbermaid Brute #2643 44- . . Continental Mfg. . .

142\ Gallon can wilid #2645 and dolly 8 EA | Continental 4445, $455.12 4444GY, 4445GY, $667.60 No Bid No Bid
#2640 ’ 3255
Trash can, restroom, covered, 18- $70.07 $62.95

143. | quart, step-on, Rubbermaid 13 EA Continen{al 18BE $910.91 Continental Mfg. $818.35 No Bid No Bid
#6142 18WH
Trays, 6 compartment, 10" x 14",

144. | Carlisle #43988, 12/case, any 7,500 CS $113.22 $849,150.00 $44.27 $332,025.00 $3.75 $28,125.00
color available
Tray, flat, fiberglass 12" x 167,

145. Amazon Blue, Cambro #1216 700 EA $8.46 $5,922.00 $7.20 $5,040.00 $6.99 $4,893.00

146. | Tray, cater, Vollrath #47251 12 EA $13.69 $164.28 $11.66 $139.92 $12.85 $154.20

147. | Tray, round, Vollrath #47216 18 EA $22.15 $398.70 $18.86 $339.48 $20.75 $373.50
Tray, ice cube, plastic, . . $3.99 . .

148. Rubbermaid #2865 24 EA No Bid No Bid Stanton 3349 $95.76 No Bid No Bid
Turner, hamburger, 4” x 5%”

149. | blade, American Metalcraft 12 EA $6.35 $76.20 $4.63 $55.56 $5.65 $67.80
#PS19075 (for pizza service)
Urn, tea, SS, 3 gallon, Cecilware $90.44

150. 453 5 EA $82.25 $411.25 Floomfield 8699 $452.20 $96.60 $483.00
Whip, wire, French SS wires,

151. | brassplated, 14" long, Vollrath 15 EA $6.87 $103.05 $5.85 $87.75 $7.35 $110.25
#47092
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