PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #S-DJ-8307

TELEVISION LAB EQUIPMENT

FEBRUARY 27, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

CDW Government, Inc.
230 N. Milwaukee Ave.
Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Matt Flood, Bid Support Supervisor

Phone: 866-773-7440
Fax: 203-899-4963

Videotape Products, Inc.
2721 West Magnolia Blvd.
Burbank, CA 91505
John M. Niren, Senior Account
Executive
Phone: 800-422-2444
Fax: 818-566-8989

Item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Video Camera, Cannon ZR-800 Mini DV W/basic kit —

1. Brand Name Only 30 Each $248.00 $7,440.00 $256.00 $7,680.00

2. Video Camera, Sony DSR-PD170- Brand Name Only 4 Each $2,898.00 $11,592.00 $2,899.00 $11,596.00

3. Mono Pod, Impact 2107 Monopod - Brand Name Only 2 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tripod, Smith-Victor P910 Pinnacle Tripod with 3-Way Each : . . .

4. Pan/Tilt Head (Quick Release) - Brand Name Only 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tripod, Davis & Sanford ProVista 7518 Fluid Head- Each . . . .

5. Brand Name Only 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Digital Still Camera, Fuji Film — Fine Pics S800fd plus Each . .

6. basic kit- Brand Name Only 4 $339.00 $1,356.00 No Bid No Bid
Microphone, Sony UWP-C1 True Diversity Wireless Lav- Each . .

7. Brand Name Only 4 No Bid No Bid $418.00 $1,672.00
Microphone, Samson - SAAM CU 5K Airline Series- Each . . . .

8. Brand Name Only 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Camera Battery, Cannon BP-2L14 Battery Pack- Brand Each

9. Name Only 15 $54.00 $810.00 $59.00 $885.00
Battery Charger, Impact CM-NB2L Mini AC/DC Battery Each ; . . .

10. Charger- Brand Name Only 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Camera Batteries, Series 7 SL-50 Lithium Battery Pack - Each : . . .

11. 7.2 VDC- Brand Name Only 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Battery Charger, Series 7 BCL-1 Quick Charger - for SL- Each : . . .

12. 50 Batteries- Brand Name Only 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Camera cases, Sony LC-PD170TH Thermodyne Case- Each : .

13. Brand Name Only 4 No Bid No Bid $197.00 $788.00
Microphone, Sennheiser ME67/K6 - Shotgun Condenser Each
Microphone Deluxe Kit

14. Includes: ME67/K6 Shotgun Microphone, Universal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shock Mount, Rycote Softie, K-Tek Boompole, Universal
Hand grip, Right Angled XLR Cables- Brand Name Only
Tape storage rack, Datrax / Bryco MDV-50 MiniDV Each : : : .

15 Plastic Rack - for 50 MiniDV Tapes- Brand Name Only 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mini DV Tapes, Sony DVM-60PR 60 Minute Premium Each

16| Mini DV Video Cassette- Brand Name Only 300 $3.00 $900.00 $3.00 $900.00
Headphones, Sony MDR-NC6 - Noise-Canceling Stereo Each

17. Headphones. Brand Name Only 10 $34.00 $340.00 $40.00 $400.00

Grand Total Amount $22,438.00 $23,921.00




S-DJ-8307
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VSA, Inc.

6929 Second Ave.
Lincoln, ME 68507
Marty Shrader, Bid Specialist
Phone: 800-888-2140
Fax: 402-467-3780

VSC, Inc.
46725 Magellan
Novi, Ml 48374
Lorraine Kemmer, Vice President
Phone: 800-872-5744
Fax: 877-926-2540

Item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Video Camera, Cannon ZR-800 Mini DV W/basic kit —

1. Brand Name Only 30 Each $243.18 $7,295.40 $325.00 $9,750.00

2. Video Camera, Sony DSR-PD170- Brand Name Only 4 Each $2,756.61 $11,026.44 $2,570.00 $10,300.00

3. Mono Pod, Impact 2107 Monopod - Brand Name Only 2 Each $27.42 $54.84 No Bid No Bid
Tripod, Smith-Victor P910 Pinnacle Tripod with 3-Way Each

4 Pan/Tilt Head (Quick Release) - Brand Name Only 30 $36.77 $1,103.10 $49.95 $1,498.50
Tripod, Davis & Sanford ProVista 7518 Fluid Head- Each . .

5. Brand Name Only 4 $199.43 $797.72 No Bid No Bid
Digital Still Camera, Fuji Film — Fine Pics S800fd plus Each . .

6. basic kit- Brand Name Only 4 $337.89 $1,351.56 No Bid No Bid
Microphone, Sony UWP-C1 True Diversity Wireless Lav- Each

7. Brand Name Only 4 $420.33 $1,681.32 $475.00 $1,900.00
Microphone, Samson - SAAM CU 5K Airline Series- Each

8. Brand Name Only 15 $425.64 $6,384.60 $414.90 $6,223.50
Camera Battery, Cannon BP-2L14 Battery Pack- Brand Each

9. Name Only 15 $52.32 $784.80 $56.00 $840.00
Battery Charger, Impact CM-NB2L Mini AC/DC Battery Each

10. Charger- Brand Name Only 15 $25.86 $387.90 $25.95 $389.25
Camera Batteries, Series 7 SL-50 Lithium Battery Pack - Each

11. 7.2 VDC- Brand Name Only 4 $109.62 $438.48 $119.75 $479.00
Battery Charger, Series 7 BCL-1 Quick Charger - for SL- Each

12. 50 Batteries- Brand Name Only 4 $128.74 $514.96 $129.95 $519.80
Camera cases, Sony LC-PD170TH Thermodyne Case- Each

13. Brand Name Only 4 $195.62 $782.48 $242.95 $971.80
Microphone, Sennheiser ME67/K6 - Shotgun Condenser Each
Microphone Deluxe Kit

14. Includes: ME67/K6 Shotgun Microphone, Universal 2 $1,144.61 $2,289.22 No Bid No Bid
Shock Mount, Rycote Softie, K-Tek Boompole, Universal
Hand grip, Right Angled XLR Cables- Brand Name Only
Tape storage rack, Datrax / Bryco MDV-50 MiniDV Each : .

15 Plastic Rack - for 50 MiniDV Tapes- Brand Name Only 6 $16.43 $98.58 No Bid No Bid
Mini DV Tapes, Sony DVM-60PR 60 Minute Premium Each

16| Mini DV Video Cassette- Brand Name Only 300 $1.88 $564.00 $2.69 $807.00
Headphones, Sony MDR-NC6 - Noise-Canceling Stereo Each

17. Headphones- Brand Name Only 10 $34.80 $348.00 $36.95 $369.50

Grand Total Amount $35,903.40 $34,048.35




