Bid Tabulation
S-NM-8310

Food Service Equipment - Tilting Kettles, Combi

Ovens, Sinks, Disposals, Work Tables

June 12, 2008 @ 2:00 pm
Nancy Markov, Buyer
703-791-8742
FAX: 703-791-7462

Acme Paper & Supply
James Brener, Account Manager
8229 Sandy Ct.

P.O. Box 422
Savage, MD 20763
Phone: 800-462-5812 ext. 1264
Fax: 410-792-2137

American Energy Restaurant
Equipment, LLC
James Strickler, Manager
7538 Fullerton Ct.
Springfield, VA 22153
Phone: 703-644-6666 ext. 642
Fax: 703-913-0586

David B. Lewis, Ltd.
Charles G. Dillow, President
6514 Sara Alyce Ct.
Burke, VA 22015
Phone: 703-569-4100
Fax: 703-569-2811

Item

Description

Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Tilting Kettle, Market Forge Brand only, No
Substitute. Model MT40EO.

Two kettles are 480V for Gar-Field HS

One kettle is 208V for Montclair ES

$15,984.21

$47,952.63

$14,790.00

$44,370.00

$16,059.00

$48,177.00

Combi Oven, Rational Brand only. No
Substitute. Model SCC 102.

Two ovens for Forest Park HS; two ovens
for Gar-field HS; two ovens for Hylton HS;
one oven for Beville MS; one oven for
Montclair ES (unit for Montclair requires
some disassembly to fit in school doorway)

$17,015.20

$136,121.60

$16,955.00

$135,640.00

$17,480.00

$139,840.00

One Compartment Sink with Left and
Right Drainboards, Eagle Brand only, model
314-24-1 PLUS Insinkerator Disposal,
brand name only, No Substitute, model SS-
200-18C-CC202.

One sink with disposal for Battlefield HS;
One sink with disposal for Forest Park HS;
One sink with disposal for Hylton HS.

$4,607.50

$13,822.50

$4,385.00

$13,155.00

$15,176.00

$45,528.00

Work Table, 5-ft., Eagle Brand only, No
Substitute, Model T3060STEM.

One table for Battlefield HS;

One table for Forest Park HS;

One table for Hylton HS.

$1,013.67

$3,041.01

$1,070.00

$3,210.00

$4,212.00

$12,636.00




Bid Tabulation
S-NM-8310
Food Service Equipment — Tilting Kettles, Combi
Ovens, Sinks, Disposals, Work Tables
June 12, 2008 @ 2:00 pm
Nancy Markov, Buyer

Factory Direct Food Service
George Athas, Vice President
2419 Grenoble Rd.
Richmond, VA 23294
Phone: 804-359-6960
Fax: 804-359-6939

Great Lakes Hotel Supply
Company
David Israel, Vice President
1961 Grand River Ave.
Detroit, Ml 48226
Phone: 313-962-9176
Fax: 313-962-1317

Harwill Food Service
Aaron Spaid, Sales Manager
531 McGhee Rd.
Winchester, VA 22603
Phone: 540-662-1124
Fax: 540-662-3974

703-791-8742
FAX: 703-791-7462

Item

Description

Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Tilting Kettle, Market Forge Brand only, No
Substitute. Model MT40EO.

Two kettles are 480V for Gar-Field HS

One kettle is 208V for Montclair ES

2 @ $15,645.00
1@ $14,578.00

$45,868.00

$16,051.00

$48,153.00

2 @ 16,294.69
1@ 15,483.24

$48,072.62

Combi Oven, Rational Brand only. No
Substitute. Model SCC 102.

Two ovens for Forest Park HS; two ovens
for Gar-field HS; two ovens for Hylton HS;
one oven for Beville MS; one oven for
Montclair ES (unit for Montclair requires
some disassembly to fit in school doorway)

7 @ $17,055.00
1@ 17,455.00

$136,840.00

$19,926.00

$159,408.00

7@ $17,162.70
1@ $17,562.70

$137,701.60

One Compartment Sink with Left and
Right Drainboards, Eagle Brand only, model
314-24-1 PLUS Insinkerator Disposal,
brand name only, No Substitute, model SS-
200-18C-CC202.

One sink with disposal for Battlefield HS;
One sink with disposal for Forest Park HS;
One sink with disposal for Hylton HS.

$4,434.00

$13,302.00

$6,720.00

$20,160.00

$4,712.53

$14,137.59

Work Table, 5-ft., Eagle Brand only, No
Substitute, Model T3060STEM.

One table for Battlefield HS;

One table for Forest Park HS;

One table for Hylton HS.

$1,018.00

$3,054.00

$2,075.00

$6,225.00

$1,067.02

$3,201.06




Bid Tabulation
S-NM-8310

Food Service Equipment — Tilting Kettles, Combi

Ovens, Sinks, Disposals, Work Tables

June 12, 2008 @ 2:00 pm
Nancy Markov, Buyer
703-791-8742
FAX: 703-791-7462

Kamran & Co., Inc.
Claudia Ponce, Estimator
411 E. Montecito St.
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
Phone: 805-963-3016 ext. 125
Fax: 805-962-5915

Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Marc Tell, President

300 Smith St.

Farmingdale, NY 11735
Phone: 631-501-9700
Fax: 631-501-9709

Item

Description

Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Tilting Kettle, Market Forge Brand only, No
Substitute. Model MT40EO.

Two kettles are 480V for Gar-Field HS

One kettle is 208V for Montclair ES

$14,190.00

$42,570.00

$15,647.63

$46,942.89

Combi Oven, Rational Brand only. No
Substitute. Model SCC 102.

Two ovens for Forest Park HS; two ovens
for Gar-field HS; two ovens for Hylton HS;
one oven for Beville MS; one oven for
Montclair ES (unit for Montclair requires
some disassembly to fit in school doorway)

$18,750.00
(plus additional $200.00
for oven at Montclair ES)

$150,200.00

$24,269.77

$194,158.16

One Compartment Sink with Left and
Right Drainboards, Eagle Brand only, model
314-24-1 PLUS Insinkerator Disposal,
brand name only, No Substitute, model SS-
200-18C-CC202.

One sink with disposal for Battlefield HS;
One sink with disposal for Forest Park HS;
One sink with disposal for Hylton HS.

No Bid

No Bid

$6,360.02

$19,080.06

Work Table, 5-ft., Eagle Brand only, No
Substitute, Model T3060STEM.

One table for Battlefield HS;

One table for Forest Park HS;

One table for Hylton HS.

No Bid

No Bid

$1,510.88

$4,532.64




