PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC
SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-BB-9013
CLASSROOM TRAILER REMOVAL,
TRANSPORT AND SET-UP SERVICES
December 11, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

BWB Construction, Inc.
3819 Reedsford Rd.
Clinton, NC 28328
Brad W. Byers, President
Phone: (910) 385-7763
Fax: (910) 590-2923

Modular Technologies, Inc.
P.O. Box 6026
Kinston, NC 28501
Terry Andrews, President
Phone: (800) 832-4668
Fax: (252) 522-9475

OPTION A
TRANSPORT SERVICES ONLY
Item .. Estimated . . . . .

# Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount
8.1. | Transport 25 Each $475.00 $11,875.00 No Bid No Bid
8.2. ESC".” 25 Each $10.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid

ervice
GRAND TOTAL AMOUNT - OPTION A $12,125.00 NO BID
Addendum #1 Yes Yes




PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC
SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-BB-9013
CLASSROOM TRAILER REMOVAL,
TRANSPORT AND SET-UP SERVICES
December 11, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

BWB Construction, Inc.
3819 Reedsford Rd.
Clinton, NC 28328
Brad W. Byers, President
Phone: (910) 385-7763
Fax: (910) 590-2923

Modular Technologies, Inc.
P.O. Box 6026
Kinston, NC 28501
Terry Andrews, President
Phone: (800) 832-4668
Fax: (252) 522-9475

OPTION B
REMOVAL, TRANSPORT, INSTALLATION AND SET-UP SERVICES ONLY
Item .. Estimated . . . . .
# Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount
g.3. | Unblock and 25 Each $375.00 $9,375.00 $546.00 $13,650.00
| Unanchor ) ’ ’ ) ’ )
8.4. | Install Hitch 25 Each $40.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $25.00
Install Axles

8.5. | (set = max of 25 Set $1.00 $25.00 $3.00 $75.00
3)
Install
Additional

8.6. Axles (over 25 Each $70.00 $1,750.00 $1.00 $25.00
the 3)

8.7. | Transport 25 Each $475.00 $11,875.00 $400.00 $10,000.00
Escort

8.8. Service 25 Each $10.00 $250.00 $125.00 $3,125.00
Haul Cinder

8.9. Blocks 25 Each $95.00 $2,375.00 $1.00 $25.00

8.10. ﬁﬁg;\o"a' of 25 Each $35.00 $875.00 $1.00 $25.00
Removal of

8.11. | Wheels (set 25 Set $120.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $25.00
= max of 6)




PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC
SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-BB-9013
CLASSROOM TRAILER REMOVAL,
TRANSPORT AND SET-UP SERVICES
December 11, 2008 @ 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

BWB Construction, Inc.
3819 Reedsford Rd.
Clinton, NC 28328
Brad W. Byers, President
Phone: (910) 385-7763
Fax: (910) 590-2923

Modular Technologies, Inc.
P.O. Box 6026
Kinston, NC 28501
Terry Andrews, President
Phone: (800) 832-4668
Fax: (252) 522-9475

Item Description Estima_ted Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount
#1 Quantity

g.12, | Installation of 25 Each $400.00 $10,000.00 $150.00 $3,750.00
Skirting
Install

8.13 | Wheels (set 25 Set $120.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $25.00
=max of 6)
Block and

8.14 Anchor 25 Each $750.00 $18,750.00 $796.00 $19,900.00

GRAND TOTAL AMOUNT - OPTION B $62,275.00 $50,650.00

Addendum #1 Yes Yes




