PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Benz Microscope Optics Center, Inc.

P.O. Box 7022
Ann Arbor, Ml 48107
Michael L. Benz, President
Phone: (734) 994-3880
Fax: (734) 994-9090

Bio Corporation
3911 Nevada St.
Alexandria, MN 56308
Rebecca Hedstrom, Manager
Phone: (320) 763-9094
Fax: (320) 763-3858

PRICING SCHEDULE

Item Est Unit of Bidder’s Delivery Bidder’s Delivery
No Description at ’ Issue “Approved Unit Price | Total Price ARO “Approved | Unit Price | Total Price ARO
) Y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 #H1050 $24.36 $730.80 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 #H10100 $25.44 $763.20 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. Beakers, 250 mL 30 Pkg/12 #H10250 $29.40 $882.00 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 #H10500 $19.44 $583.20 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 #US1005 $23.28 $1,164.00 | 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
1000 mL)
Electricity Kit
(Complete wicircuitry
6. wiwires, switches, and | - 5, Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
battery holders; Bulbs
& holders, bulb and
bulb holders)
Educational Grade, ALT:
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 ' $73.20 $732.00 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
. ) #US7100
Vista Cylinders, 100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
9. Mitosis Poster 50 Ea #AZ1025 $12.95 $647.50 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
10. gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea #.CA4T6 $36.00 | $2,160.00 | 0-120 Days | NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Disposable Petri _ $3.80 i
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 ALT: 7154 Pk 20 $114.00 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. Droppers 30 Pkg/12 #5470 $1.39 $41.70 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
13. Stop Watch 30 Ea #6042 $1.99 $59.70 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Benz Microscope Optics Center, Inc.
P.O. Box 7022
Ann Arbor, Ml 48107
Michael L. Benz, President
Phone: (734) 994-3880
Fax: (734) 994-9090

Bio Corporation
3911 Nevada St.
Alexandria, MN 56308
Rebecca Hedstrom, Manager
Phone: (320) 763-9094
Fax: (320) 763-3858

PRICING SCHEDULE

Item Est Unit of Bidder’s Delivery Bidder’s Delivery
N Description at ’ Issue “Approved Unit Price | Total Price ARO “Approved | Unit Price | Total Price ARO
o Y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 4, Ea #5402 $5.99 | $599.00 | 0-120 Days | NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
w/Wax; (11" x 7" x 1.57)
15, g{;lseed'”g Pins, 2°T- 1 70 | Pkg/100 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
16. | JestTubes, Pyrex 50 | Pkg/50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Rimless
Thermometers T203 (Partial) .99 $29.70 )
17. (mercury free) 30 Ea T202 (Total) 99 $29.70 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
18. Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea #W200 $60.00 $1,800.00 | 0-120 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Grand Total Amount $10,306.80 NO BID

Addendum #1

Yes — 04/01/08

Yes — 04/01/08

Reference #08-30;

Reference #07-07;

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Microscope Unit Discounts: Swift (all models) —
30%; Ken-A-Vision (all models — 20%; Meiji (all
models) — 22%; National (all models except
digital) — 39%, Digital — 30%; Leica (all models) —
22%; Walter Products (all models) — 30%; Unico
— 25%; Labomed — 23%; All microscope
accessories (excluding bulbs) — 10%, Bulbs —
Net; Economy, Acculab, A&D, Denver
Instruments & Ohaus Balances — 20%;
Elementary Balances/Platform/Spring Scales —
10%; Accessories — 10%; Video Systems — 20%;
Video accessories — 10%; Laboratory & Science
Supplies — 15%; Delivery ARO: Stock - 120
Days Exclusions: Microscope lamps, prepared
slides, glass beakers, cylinders & flasks,
stackable slide storage cabinet (#52580, S2582)
& Gravity Convection Lab Ovens, All Lab
Incubators, zPix Digital Microscope

Discount Min. Order $250.00;
Free S&H on Vacuum Packed orders;
Orders Under: $500.00 — 1% Discount off

order

Orders Over $500.00 — 2% Discount off order
Orders Over $1,000.00 — 4%
Orders Over $1,500.00 — 4.5%
Orders Over $2,000.00 — 5%
Exceptions: Live, special orders, special

shipping

Delivery ARO: 21 Days
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Cynmar Corporation

P.O. Box 530

Carlinville, IL 62626

Linda S. Huyear, National Sales Manager

Phone: (800) 223-3517
Fax: (800) 754-5154

Delta Education, LLC
80 Northwest Blvd., P.O. Box 3000
Nashua, NH 03063
Theresa Austin, Bids Admin
Phone: (800) 338-5270 — Ext. 433
Fax: (866) 767-6942

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
I:‘le;n Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
: y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)

1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 Kimax $28.25 $847.50 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 Kimax $30.00 $900.00 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. Beakers, 250 mL 30 Pkg/12 Kimax $28.50 $855.00 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 Kimax $20.43 $1,021.50 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

1000 mL)

Electricity Kit

(Complete wicircuitry

w/wires, switches, and Lab
6. battery holders: Bulbs 30 Ea Connections $64.08 $1,922.40 7-30 750-2615 | $37.80 $1,134.00 15-30

& holders, bulb and

bulb holders)

Educational Grade, Sebata
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 Ee $54.00 $540.00 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

. . ax12

Vista Cylinders, 100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea Aakron Rule $2.00 $400.00 7-30 130-1651 $3.53 $706.00 15-30
9. Mitosis Poster 50 Ea Biocam $18.53 $926.50 7-30 161-7350 $17.81 $890.50 15-30
10. gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea PrintLab | $35.63 | $2,137.80 | 7-30 162-6048 | $11.56 $693.60 15-30

Disposable Petri Akro Mils
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 25 $3.90 $117.00 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. | Droppers 30 Pkg/12 C&ASai $2.00 $60.00 7-30 040-1554 $2.23 $66.90 15-30
13. | Stop Watch 30 Ea Mychron $5.18 $155.40 7-30 193-9143 $11.56 $346.80 15-30
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Cynmar Corporation
P.O. Box 530
Carlinville, IL 62626

Linda S. Huyear, National Sales Manager

Phone: (800) 223-3517
Fax: (800) 754-5154

Delta Education, LLC
80 Northwest Blvd., P.O. Box 3000
Nashua, NH 03063
Theresa Austin, Bids Admin
Phone: (800) 338-5270 — Ext. 433
Fax: (866) 767-6942

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
I:‘le;n Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
: y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 4, Ea Pacific Sci $8.75 $875.00 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
w/Wax; (11" x7” x 1.5”)
15, g{;lseed'”g Pins, 2°T- 1 70 | Pkg/100 | PacificSci | $1.67 | $116.90 7-30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
16, | Jest Tubes, Pyrex 50 | Pkg/50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Rimless
17, | Thermometers 30 Ea $1.60 $48.00 7-30 | 200-1097 | $2.63 $78.90 15-30
(mercury free)
18. | Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea Onaus $88.00 $2,640.00 531637 $79.43 $2,382.90 15-30
Grand Total Amount $14,867.00 $6,299.60
Addendum #1 Yes — 04/01/08 Yes
Reference #BQ2719/5S Reference #2008CD

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

5% discount off catalog. See attachment,

Minimum order of $25.00

Exceptions: No discounts on chemicals,

media preserved specimens; quantity

discounts, clearance, sale and special orders
Standard freight charges apply to chemicals,
preserved specimens, media, large equipment

and furniture.
Delivery ARO: 7-30 Days

Volume Discounts apply to Pre-K -6 Math &
Science catalog only as follows:

$0.00 - $249.99 — List price

$250.00 - $499.99 — 5% Discount off catalog
$500.00 - $999.99 — 10% Discount off catalog
$1,000.00 — 15% Discount off catalog

All orders will be FOB Nashua, NH;

S&H is @ 10% w/minimum charge of $5.00
Delivery ARO: 15-30 Days

Exclusions: All Delta Exclusive items; FOSS,
Delta Science modules (DSM), SCIS 3+, Science
in a Nutshell, Fast Food and the Seeds of
Science Roots of Reading program. Living
materials and any items not listed in PreK-6
Science & Math catalog.
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

ETA/Cuisenaire

500 Greenview Court
Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Carolyn Vanco, Coodinator, Catalog Bids
Phone: (800) 445-5985 — Ext. 5177

Fax: (888) 333-9588

Earth’s Birthday Project
P.O. Box 1536
Santa Fe, NM 87504-1536
Mark Landau, Prof. Development
Phone: (505) 986-6040
Fax: (505) 984-9176

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
I:‘le;n Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
: y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 71024 $29.65 $889.50 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 71025 $30.56 $916.80 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. | Beakers, 250 mL 30 | Pkg/12 71027 $35.96 | $1,078.80 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 NA NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 56323 $17.96 $898.00 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
1000 mL)
Electricity Kit
(Complete wicircuitry
w/wires, switches, and
6. battery holders; Bulbs 30 Ea 20365 $67.46 $2,023.80 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
& holders, bulb and
bulb holders)
Educational Grade,
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 71043 $80.96 $809.60 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Cylinders, 100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea 516 $3.08 $616.00 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
9. | Mitosis Poster 50 Ea 41046 $13.46 $673.00 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
10. gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea 23362 $10.76 | $645.60 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Disposable Petri
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 49888 $3.83/20 $114.90 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. | Droppers 30 Pkg/12 11085-12 $2.66 $79.80 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
13. | Stop Watch 30 Ea 4678 $6.52 $195.60 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

ETA/Cuisenaire
500 Greenview Court
Vernon Hills, IL 60061
Carolyn Vanco, Coodinator, Catalog Bids
Phone: (800) 445-5985 — Ext. 5177
Fax: (888) 333-9588

Earth’s Birthday Project
P.O. Box 1536
Santa Fe, NM 87504-1536
Mark Landau, Prof. Development
Phone: (505) 986-6040
Fax: (505) 984-9176

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
I:‘le;n Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
: y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 4, Ea 23363 $11.66 | $1,166.00 | 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
w/Wax; (11" x7” x 1.5”)
15. g{;lseec“”g Pins, 2°T- 1 70 | Pkg/100 23096 $4.46 | $312.20 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
16, | Jest Tubes, Pyrex 50 | Pkg/50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Rimless
17, | Thermometers 30 Ea 572-1 $.90 $27.00 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
(mercury free)
18. | Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea 14001 $101.64 | $3,048.30 7-10 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Grand Total Amount $13,494.90 NO BID
Addendum #1 Yes Yes — 04/01/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Reference PWCS R-KS-8032

10% Discount off products beginning with
T8 only; S&H free with order of $25.00 or
more. Order less than $25.00 do receive the
appropriate discount but incur a $5.00 S&H
charge; Next day, 2™ day select are excluded
from free shipping terms. Exclusions: All
ETA/Cuisenaire items with the P in the 3™
position are excluded from catalog discount.
Delivery ARO: 7-10 Days

5% off current catalog; No exceptions
Delivery ARO: 10 Days
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.
BID TABULATION

Fisher Science Education

4500 Turnberry Dr.
Hanover Park, IL 60133

Jennifer Schumaker, Contracts Specialist

Phone: (800) 955-1177
Fax: (800) 955-4763

Forestry Supplies, Inc.
P.O. Box 8397
Jackson, MS 39284-8397

Don Nabors, Contract Sales Rep.

Phone: (800) 752-8461
Fax: (800) 813-2704

PRICING SCHEDULE

Est Unit of Bidder’s Unit Delivery Bidder’s Unit Delivery
Item No. Description ) “Approved . Total Price ARO “Approved . Total Price ARO
Qty Issue » Price » Price
Equal (In Days) Equal (In Days)

1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 S76100D $20.54 $616.20 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 S7600E $21.68 $650.40 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. Beakers, 250 mL 30 Pkg/12 S76100G $18.70 $561.00 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 S76100J $13.96 $418.80 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 S63266 $18.06 $903.00 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

1000 mL)

Electricity Kit

(Complete wicircuitry

w/wires, switches, and )
6. battery holders; Bulbs 30 Ea S66048 $90.42 $2,712.60 | 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

& holders, bulb and

bulb holders)

Educational Grade,
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 S95186C $66.16 $661.60 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

Vista Cylinders, 100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea S40625 $2.38 $476.00 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
9. Mitosis Poster 50 Ea S65130 $9.95 $497.50 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
10. gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea S45517 $14.16 | $849.60 | 57Days | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A

Disposable Petri
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 S33580 $3.77 $113.10 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. Droppers 30 Pkg/12 S79383 $5.59 $167.70 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
13. Stop Watch 30 Ea S94792 $3.89 $116.70 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Fisher Science Education
4500 Turnberry Dr.
Hanover Park, IL 60133
Jennifer Schumaker, Contracts Specialist
Phone: (800) 955-1177
Fax: (800) 955-4763

Forestry Supplies, Inc.

P.O. Box 8397
Jackson, MS 39284-8397
Don Nabors, Contract Sales Rep.
Phone: (800) 752-8461
Fax: (800) 813-2704

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
Item No. Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 4, Ea S65105 $6.15 | $615.00 | 57 Days | NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
w/Wax; (11" x 7" x 1.5”)
15. g{;lseec“”g Pins, 2" T- 70 | Pkg/100 | S174302 $5.96 $417.20 | 5-7Days | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
16, | Jest Tubes, Pyrex 50 | Pkg/50 | S76111F $15.65 | $782.50 | 5-7Days | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Rimless
17. | Thermometers 30 Ea S41574 $2.96 $88.80 | 5-7Days | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
(mercury free)
. S400200 or
18. Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea S97280 $61.66 $1,849.80 | 5-7 Days NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Grand Total Amount $12,497.50 NO BID
Addendum #1 Yes Yes — 04/01/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Reference #BL-606746-08F; 26% Disc off
Fisher Scientific Education 2008 General
Catalog; New Catalog Feb 1, 2009;
Exclusions: ltems ending in ND

Free Shipping on all orders over $200.00,
excluding live, hazardous, motor freight
items. Fuel surcharge will applied (Itr
attached) Hazardous materials surcharge of
$21.50 per order will be charged where
applicable. Anticipated Delivery ARO: 7-10
Days

Reference: #733;

7% discount off current catalog, New catalog

Feb 1;
Delivery ARO: 3 days
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Frey Scientific a Div. of Delta Education, LLC
80 Northwest Blvd.
Nashua, NH 03063
Trish Fields, Asst. Sec., Bid/Contract Mgr.
Phone: (800) 225-3739
Fax: (877) 256-3739

Nebraska Scientific

3823 Leavenworth Street

Omaha, NE 68105-1180

Thomas J. Trapp, Vice President

Phone: (800) 228-7117
Fax: (402) 346-2216

PRICING SCHEDULE

Est Unit of Bidder’s Unit Delivery Bidder’s Unit Delivery
Item No. Description ) “Approved . Total Price ARO “Approved . Total Price ARO
Qty Issue » Price » Price
Equal (In Days) Equal (In Days)

1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 | Pkg/MM2 | 15-529623-21 | $20.58 $617.40 10-45 LW310 $12.06 $361.80 | 7-14 Days
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 15-529624-21 $21.73 $651.90 10-45 LW315 $12.33 $369.90 7-14 Days
3. Beakers, 250 mL 30 | Pkg/M2 | 15-529626-21 | $18.74 $562.20 10-45 LW320 $11.25 $337.50 | 7-14 Days
4. Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 15-1016949-21 $22.71 $681.30 10-45 LW325 $13.05 $391.50 7-14 Days

Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 15-574090-21 $18.45 $922.50 10-45 BP Set7 $22.77 $1,138.50 7-14 Days

1000 mL)

Electricity Kit

(Complete wicircuitry

w/wires, switches, ) ) . ) i
6. and battery holders; 30 Ea 15-560962-21 $12.89 $386.70 10-45 A220-1623 | $112.46 $3,373.80 7-14 Days

Bulbs & holders, bulb

and bulb holders)

Educational Grade,
7. | PlasticBase, Pyrex | 45 | prg2 | 15-531715-21 | $6553 | $65530 | 1045 | “W10HA- | ge745 | 57150 | 7-14 Days

Vista Cylinders, 10

100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea 15-081901-21 $.99 $198.00 10-45 CM1§§261 $4.95 $990.00 7-14 Days
9. Mitosis Poster 50 Ea 15-577567-21 $10.97 $548.50 10-45 AZ35-1025 $12.55 $627.50 7-14 Days
10. gﬁg?td'c Table Wall 60 Ea 15-574007-21 | $20.25 | $1,215.00 | 10-45 | CH4230 | $29.25 | $1,755.00 | 7-14 Days
19, | Disposable Petri 30 | Pkg/24 | 15-578924-21 | $3.35 | $100.50 10-45 | CS200A | $7.16 | $214.80 | 7-14 Days

Dishes, 100 x 15 mm
12. Droppers 30 Pkg/12 15-569723-21 $1.68 $50.40 10-45 DE265 $4.05 $121.50 7-14 Days
13. Stop Watch 30 Ea 15-595699-21 $6.02 $180.60 10-45 WEB1055 $7.16 $214.80 7-14 Days
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Frey Scientific a Div. of Delta Education, LLC
80 Northwest Blvd.
Nashua, NH 03063
Trish Fields, Asst. Sec., Bid/Contract Mgr.
Phone: (800) 225-3739
Fax: (877) 256-3739

Nebraska Scientific
3823 Leavenworth Street
Omaha, NE 68105-1180

Thomas J. Trapp, Vice President

Phone: (800) 228-7117
Fax: (402) 346-2216

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
Item No. Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
Student Dissection
14. Pan w/Wax; (11" x 77 100 Ea 15-568859-21 $6.93 $693.00 10-45 DE275A $8.55 $855.00 7-14 Days
x 1.5”)
15, g{;lseec“”g Pins, 2°T- | 70 | Pkg/100 | 15-595878-21 | $6.18 | $117.42 | 10-45 | DE284C | $10.75 | $752.50 | 7-14 Days
16. | JestTubes, Pyrex 50 | Pkg/50 | 15-529696-21 | $13.88 | $694.00 | 10-45 | LW2216A | $22.46 | $1,123.00 | 7-14 Days
Vista Rimless
17. | Thermometers 30 Ea 15-1017416-21 | $7.19 $215.70 10-45 AP1042 $5.85 $175.50 | 7-14 Days
(mercury free)
18. Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea 15-1017515-21 $92.39 $2,771.70 10-45 WAB-200-0 $80.96 $2,422.80 7-14 Days
Grand Total Amount $11,262.12 $15,796.40
Addendum #1 Yes Yes — 04/01/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Reference C-025432668-F

27% discount off 2008 (current) Frey Scientific
and Frey Scientific Elementary catalogs; new
catalogs effective Jan 1.

Exclusions: No discount on hazardous
chemicals or items with a prefix of 11. Discount
does not apply to sales flyers or promotions
during the term of agreement. Free S&H on all
items except: live specimens and hazardous
materials. Some products like furniture require
an additional handling charge due to package
size, shipment method or weight (call customer
svc to determine additional freight charges);
Delivery ARO: 10-45 days

Reference NEBSCI-1008-10F

10% Discount off current catalog list price
(new catalog Jan1); Exclusions: Living
specimens, NeoSci Curriculum correlated
products, special order and promotional items.
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.
BID TABULATION

Para Scientific Co.
297 Cedar Lane
Fairless Hills, PA 19030
Al Kalata, Quote Manager
Phone: (215) 736-0225
Fax: (215) 736-3290

Sargent-Welch/VWR

3850 North Wilke Road, Suite 300

Arlington Heights, IL 60004

Ray Kufeldt, Operations Mgr.

Phone: (847) 463-1180
Fax: (800) 814-0607

PRICING SCHEDULE

Est Unit of Bidder’s Unit Delivery Bidder’s Unit Delivery
Item No. Description ) “Approved . Total Price ARO “Approved . Total Price ARO
Qty Issue » Price » Price
Equal (In Days) Equal (In Days)

1. | Beakers, 50 mL 30 | Pkg/12 G"lj%%?goo' $13.98 | $419.40 W"%g%' $21.75 | $625.50 7-30
2. | Beakers, 100 mL 30 | Pkg/12 G"lj%ﬁ?oooo' $16.14 | $484.20 W"%11735' $22.95 | $688.50 7-30
3. | Beakers, 250 mL 30 | Pkgi2 | G300 | 2002 | $627.60 06 $22.00 | $660.00 7-30
4. | Beakers, 500 mL 30 | Pkglé (31'838_%3‘ $23.98 | $719.40 07 $25.91 | $777.30 7-30

Beakers (50 mL, 100
5 | mL,250mL,600mL, | 50 | Set/5 G"ljf)%%og' $10.86 | $543.00 WLSZ‘;E;?S' $18.86 | $943.00 7-30

1000 mL)

Electricity Kit

(Complete wicircuitry

w/wires, switches, and CP32959- :
6. | pattery holders: Bubs | 3 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A o0 $41.95 | $1,258.50 7-30

& holders, bulb and

bulb holders)

Educational Grade, ngn\éWR
7. | Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 | Pkg/12 | 98-7075-40 | $67.69 | $676.90 — | $60.06 | $600.60 7-30

. : WLS1735-

Vista Cylinders, 100mL 53
8. | Meter Stick 200 Ea 50-7200-00 | $1.32 | $264.00 WLS44685 | $2.78 $556.00 7-30
9. | Mitosis Poster 50 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A WL7346 | $17.98 | $899.00 7-30
10, gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 na | WESTS805 | g38.06 | s2,28360 | 730

Disposable Petri Bidding 20 pk . $4.76/pk :
1. | Diches. 100 x 15 mm 30 | Pkgi24 | g aio0.00 | $2:55/20 | $76.50 WLS26028 2 $142.80 7-30
12. | Droppers 30 | Pkg12 | S droppers | g4 57 $47.10 WLS69695 | $2.47 $74.10 7-30

' PP 9 000-1300-41 ' ' ' '
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032
SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Para Scientific Co.
297 Cedar Lane
Fairless Hills, PA 19030
Al Kalata, Quote Manager
Phone: (215) 736-0225
Fax: (215) 736-3290

Sargent-Welch/VWR
3850 North Wilke Road, Suite 300
Arlington Heights, IL 60004
Ray Kufeldt, Operations Mgr.

Phone: (847) 463-1180
Fax: (800) 814-0607

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
Item No. Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
Digital
13. Stop Watch 30 Ea 000-1397-00 $3.50 $105.00 - WLA5625 $4.05 $121.50 7-30
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 44, Ea | 000-0350-00 | $6.10 | $610.00 WLS723 | $8.10 | $810.00 7-30
w/Wax; (11" x7” x 1.5”)
15. g{;lseec“”g Pins, 2 T- | 70 | Pkg/100 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 na | WESTE 1 se70 | s469.00 7-30
Test Tubes, Pyrex 16x100 WLS79515 | $30.77 :
16. | \/icta Rimloss 50 | PKkg/50 | g eoa0030 | $15-28 | $764.00 v k7o | $1538.50 7-30
17. | Thermometers 30 Ea 90-9730-01 | $1.40 $42.00 WLSBO03S | 335 | $100.50 7-30
(mercury free) -10A
18. Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea 91-2002-60 $76.25 $2,287.50 - WLS3455 $76.70 $2,301.00 7-30
Grand Total Amount $7,666.60 $14,849.40
Addendum #1 Yes Yes — 04/02/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Reference #M8-0169;
% Discount - No Bid

Reference #RQ07-871464-57B;

catalog Jan 1); Exclusions: N/A

Delivery ARO: 7-30 days

29.5% discount off catalog list price (new
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Sciencelabs.com
P.O. Box 1657
Kyle, TX 78640
Krista Halfmann, Bid Specialist
Phone: (512) 268-2765
Fax: (512) 268-2766

The Paper People
7205A Lockport Place
Lorton, VA 22079
Joseph R. Meteyer, President
Phone: (703) 339-7113
Fax: (703) 550-7118

PRICING SCHEDULE

Est Unit of Bidder’s Unit Delivery Bidder’s Unit Delivery
Item No. Description Qt ) TS “Approved Price Total Price ARO “Approved Price Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
QWC10204-
1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 12 $13.92 $417.60 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. | Beakers, 100 mL 30 | Pkg2 | AVCI0205 | g1a50 | s437.70 30 NOBID | $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. | Beakers, 250 mL 30 | Pkg2 | AVCI0208 | g1774 | s532.20 30 NOBID | $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 QWC10211-6 | $12.35 $370.50 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Beakers (50 mL, 100 QUN - 86
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 s . $14.64 $732.00 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
ets
1000 mL)
Electricity Kit
(Complete wicircuitry
w/wires, switches, and
6. battery holders; Bulbs 30 Ea 1101 $26.50 $795.00 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
& holders, bulb and
bulb holders)
Educational Grade,
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 QUN1C(;6 137- $54.99 $549.99 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Cylinders, 100mL
Acme
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea NO BID Westcott $1.16 $232.00 5
ACM10431
9. | Mitosis Poster 50 Ea Neoﬁ%‘gg'%' $9.33 $466.20 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
10. gﬁg‘r’td'c Table Wall 60 Ea | Hubbard474 | $29.59 | $1,775.40 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Disposable Petri QWMK10040 $2.58
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 3-20 20 pk $77.40 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. Droppers 30 Pkg/12 Q97-4401 $1.17 $35.10 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Sciencelabs.com
P.O. Box 1657
Kyle, TX 78640
Krista Halfmann, Bid Specialist
Phone: (512) 268-2765
Fax: (512) 268-2766

The Paper People
7205A Lockport Place
Lorton, VA 22079
Joseph R. Meteyer, President
Phone: (703) 339-7113
Fax: (703) 550-7118

PRICING SCHEDULE

Est Unit of Bidder’s Unit Delivery Bidder’s Unit Delivery
Item No. Description ) “Approved . Total Price ARO “Approved . Total Price ARO
Qty Issue » Price » Price
Equal (In Days) Equal (In Days)
13. Stop Watch 30 Ea 7-1397 $1.99 $59.70 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
14, | Student Dissection Pan | 44, Ea | QUNDPSO001 | $5.94 | $594.00 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
w/Wax; (11" x7” x 1.5”)
Dissecting Pins, 2" T- Advantus
15. Style 70 Pkg/100 QP23422 $1.34 $93.80 30 AVT85T $2.86 $200.20 5
Test Tubes, Pyrex QUNTT9820- | $10.16
16. Vista Rimless 50 Pkg/50 A 72 pk $508.00 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
17. | Thermometers 30 Ea Q97-3001 $.97 $29.10 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
(mercury free)
18. Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea QA9119-00 $47.00 $1,410.00 30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Grand Total Amount $10,908.69 $432.20

Addendum #1

Yes — 04/01/08

Yes — 04/01/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

20% Discount off current catalog
Exceptions: Hazardous & Live materials
charges apply.

Delivery ARO: 60 days

15% discount off current School catalog list
price; Delivery ARO: 5 days
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Vernier Software & Technology
13979 SW Millikan Way
Beaverton, OR 97005-2886
Julie Pagni, Quote Administrator
Phone: (503) 277-2299
Fax: (503) 277-2440

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
Item No. Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
1. Beakers, 50 mL 30 Pkg/12 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
2. Beakers, 100 mL 30 Pkg/12 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
3. Beakers, 250 mL 30 Pkg/12 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
4, Beakers, 500 mL 30 Pkg/6 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Beakers (50 mL, 100
5. mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, 50 Set/5 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
1000 mL)
Electricity Kit
(Complete wicircuitry
w/wires, switches, and
6. battery holders; Bulbs 30 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
& holders, bulb and
bulb holders)
Educational Grade,
7. Plastic Base, Pyrex 10 Pkg/12 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Vista Cylinders, 100mL
8. Meter Stick 200 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
9. Mitosis Poster 50 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
10, | Periodic Table Wall 60 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Chart
Disposable Petri
11. Dishes, 100 x 15 mm 30 Pkg/24 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
12. | Droppers 30 Pkg/12 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
13. | Stop Watch 30 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
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PRINCE WILLIAM COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
INVITATION FOR BID #R-KS-8032

SCIENCE SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
MARCH 31, 2008 @ 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

Vernier Software & Technology
13979 SW Millikan Way
Beaverton, OR 97005-2886
Julie Pagni, Quote Administrator
Phone: (503) 277-2299
Fax: (503) 277-2440

PRICING SCHEDULE

. Bidder’s . Delivery Bidder’s . Delivery
Item No. Description EQstt l.llsnsltugf “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO “Approved Fl’Jr?(;te Total Price ARO
y Equal” (In Days) Equal” (In Days)
Student Dissection Pan
14, wiWax; (11” x 7° x 1.5%) 100 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
15. g{;lseec“”g Pins, 2 T- | 70 | Pkg/100 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Test Tubes, Pyrex
16. Vista Rimless 50 Pkg/50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
17, | Thermometers 30 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
(mercury free)
18. | Triple Beam Balance 30 Ea NO BID $0.00 $0.00 N/A
Grand Total Amount $0.00

Addendum #1

Yes — 04/01/08

Percentage Discount off Current Catalog

Reference IFB #R-KS-8032; 0% Discount
applied. Contact Bidder for items and quantity
specific price quote (bidder may not be able to
offer discounts on most Vernier manufactured
products. Exceptions: $10.00 minimum
shipping charge up to a maximum charge of
3% of total order (UPS ground)

Delivery ARO: 7-10 Days
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